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TRASH 
NOTICE

Due to the 
holiday, trash will 

be delayed by 
one day. 

Trash will be delayed 
by one day due to 

Presidents Day
 holiday on Monday, 
February 17, 2025

The Independent 
Newspaper Group 
Office will be Closed 
on Monday, Feb. 17th 

in observation of 
President’s Day.
We will reopen on 
Tuesday at 9:30 am.
Deadlines are 
Friday, Feb. 14 
at noon

Milestones
City Manager delivers annual 

State of the City Address

School committee 
reaffirms sanctuary 
district designation

Chelsea Women’s Commission to host 
International Women’s Day event

Special to the Record

City Manager Fidel Mal-
tez gave the annual State 
of the City Address in the 
City Council Chambers at 
City Hall on Monday night. 
During the address, Maltez 
looked back at the city’s 
celebration of its 400th an-
niversary and ahead to the 
Chelsea Pa’Lante, Chelsea 
Onward comprehensive 
planning process that will 
take place over the next two 
years. The text of Maltez’s 
speech is below:

Good evening, it is my 
honor to stand before you 
today, as your City Manager, 
and present the state of our 
city. I start today by extend-
ing my deepest gratitude to 
all the hardworking leaders 
who have been instrumental 
in Chelsea’s progress over 
the past year, including the 
members of our City Coun-
cil, our School Committee, 
and our dedicated state del-
egation - Representative Ju-
dith Garcia and Senator Sal 
DiDomenico. To our City 
staff, public safety teams, 
and volunteers, thank you 
for all that you do to keep 
our city running. And most 
importantly, thank you to 

the residents of Chelsea 
who continue to make this 
city a place of vibrancy and 
resilience. 

In 2024, we reached an 
incredible milestone cele-
brating the 400th anniver-
sary of our beloved City. 
Over a 12 month period, we 
came together to celebrate 
our history and honor the 
generations that have come 
before us. From the 400th 
Gala to Chelsea Day and 
the Chelsea 5k Road Race, 
this year showed our collec-
tive spirit. A special thank 
you to the Chelsea 400th 
Committee, our Law De-
partment, Recreation, Fire, 
Police, Emergency Man-
agement, the Chamber of 
Commerce, and all the vol-
unteers who helped make 
this year-long celebration 
a resounding success. Just 
as we honored the past, we 
also look toward the future. 
In alignment with our City 
Council, we announced 
Chelsea Pa’Lante, Chelsea 
Onward. This is our first 
comprehensive plan since 
1970 and will help guide 
our City over the next 10 
years. Chelsea Pa’Lante is 

By Adam Swift

The school committee 
approved a resolution origi-
nally introduced by member 
Dr. Sarah Neville reaffirm-
ing to support and reaffirm 
the school district’s status 
as a Sanctuary District in 
the wake of the presidential 
election.

The resolution also calls 
for the district to show its  
commitment to welcome, 
affirm, support, and educate 
students with diverse gender 
identities, expressions and 
sexual orientations, includ-

ing transgender and nonbi-
nary students.

Chelsea Teachers’ Union 
President Kathryn Anderson 
spoke in favor of the resolu-
tion during the public speak-
ing portion of last week’s 
school committee meeting. 
Several letters in support of 
the resolution were also read 
into the record.

“I’ve been impressed by 
all the different resources 
we have turned out in favor 
of our students and our fam-
ilies, and how quickly we 

Special to the Record

The Chelsea Women’s 
Commission will host an 
event for the International 
Women’s Day on Saturday, 
March 8, from 10 a.m. to 
1 p.m. on the Chelsea City 
Hall Lawn.

This special gathering is 
an opportunity for the wom-
en and girls of Chelsea to 
come together in commu-
nity, celebrate their collec-
tive strength, and engage in 

meaningful conversations. 
The event will feature a 
small speaking program, a 
light breakfast, and a net-
working exercise, fostering 
connections and empower-
ing participants to advocate 
for issues affecting women 
and girls in the city.

The Chelsea Women’s 
Commission was established 
to serve as a voice and advo-
cate for the women and girls 
of Chelsea. As part of its 
commitment to understand-

ing and addressing their 
needs, the Commission con-
ducted a community-wide 
survey in 2024, engaging 
more than 100 residents to 
identify key concerns and 
opportunities for advocacy. 

This International Wom-
en’s Day event marks the 
Commission’s official kick-
off, setting the stage for 
future initiatives that will 
uplift and support Chelsea’s 
women and girls.

“We are thrilled to launch 

the Chelsea Women’s Com-
mission first community 
event with this gathering 
on International Women’s 
Day,” said Lourdes Alva-
rez, Women’s Commission 
Chair. “This event is about 
bringing women together, 
fostering connections, and 
ensuring that the voices of 
Chelsea’s women and girls 
are heard. We look forward 
to building a strong network 

Special to the Record

Senator Sal DiDomenico 
recently joined a Depart-
ment of Corrections (DOC) 
simulated training, host-
ed by Executive Office of 
Public Safety and Security, 
to experience the journey 
navigated by individuals re-

turning to their community 
after being released from 
incarceration. During the 
2-hour interactive training, 
attendees assumed the role 
of a returning citizen and 
simulated the first 30 days 
post-release.

“I want to thank the 

Healey-Driscoll Adminis-
tration and Secretary Reidy 
for hosting my colleagues 
and me to learn what life 
looks like for individuals 
after they are released from 
prison,” said Senator Sal 
DiDomenico. “There are 
many obstacles that people 

face when returning to their 
communities after pris-
on and these are the kinds 
of events that help inform 
how we as a state can bet-
ter support them to ensure 
everyone has a chance to 
get ahead and reduce recid-
ivism.”

DiDomenico, colleagues attend DOC reentry simulation

Senator Sal DiDomenico (third from left) with State House colleagues at the reentry simulation event.

CHS GIRLS BASKETBALL FALLS TO 
MYSTIC VALLEY REGIONAL CHARTER SCHOOL

Melize Siliro (0) accelerates past a Mystic Valley defender and drives to the basket during the recent game against Mystic Valley 
Regional Charter School. See page 6 for more photos.

See MILESTONES Page 5

See SCHOOL Page 2

See EVENT Page 2
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SEND US YOUR NEWS
The Record encourages residents to submit engagement, wedding and birth announcements, 
news releases, business and education briefs, sports stories and photos for publication. Items 

should be forwarded to our offices at 385 Broadway, Revere, MA 02151.

 We also encourage readers to e-mail news releases and photos to 

stephen.quigley@reverejournal.com

News in Brief

HAPPY BIRTHDAY, 
DENISE JOY KARLIN

Happy Birthday (Feb. 
10) to Denise Joy Karlin, 
valedictorian of the Chelsea 
High School Class of 1976.

Denise went on to grad-
uate from Harvard College 
and Harvard Law School. 
Denise, who grew up on 
Shurtleff Street and attend-
ed the Shurtleff School, is 
the daughter of the late Reu-
ben and Golda Karlin.

Also celebrating their 
birthdays on that day were 
the great CHS basketball 
star Michael Wozniak and 
St. John’s Prep graduate 
Scott Feinstein, the out-
standing 6-foot-5-inch cen-
ter for Chelsea YMHA and 
AZA basketball teams.

COACHES WANTED 
FOR CHELSEA 
SPRING & SUMMER 
SPORTS PROGRAMS

The city,   in partnership 
with Chelsea’s youth sports 
leagues, is seeking passion-
ate, community-oriented 
individuals to fill volunteer 
coaching positions for its 
spring and summer sports 
teams. Coaching opportuni-
ties are available for various 
Chelsea sports teams, in-
cluding Baseball, Softball, 
Basketball, Flag Football, 
and Girls Volleyball.

As part of the City’s on-
going efforts to strengthen 
Chelsea’s sports programs, 
Charlie Guiffrida, Director 
of Athletic Infrastructure 
and Sports Tourism, is sup-
porting the community’s 
youth sports leagues by 
helping recruit coaches.

“We’ve heard from many 
in the community who want 
to get involved, but aren’t 
sure where to start,” said 
Charlie Guiffrida, Director 
of Athletic Infrastructure 
and Sports Tourism for the 
City of Chelsea. “Volun-
teering as a coach for our 
community’s youth sports 
leagues is a great way to 
make a positive impact on 
Chelsea’s young athletes. 
Please help us support the 
next generation of athletes 
in our community and con-
tribute to a more vibrant 
Chelsea.”

Those interested in ap-
plying are encouraged to 
submit a brief letter of in-
terest outlining their quali-
fications and experience to 
cguiffrida@chelseama.gov.

COMMUNITY 
INVITED TO 
INFORMATION 
SESSION ABOUT 
9-1-1 DISPATCH 
REGIONALIZATION

The City of Chelsea is 
hosting a 9-1-1 Dispatch 
Regionalization Informa-
tion Session to provide 
residents with information 
about the proposed region-
alization of the 9-1-1 dis-
patch operations of Chelsea, 
Revere, and Winthrop into a 
shared, state-of-the-art Re-
gional Emergency Commu-
nications Center (RECC). 

The information session 
will be held on Tuesday, 
Feb. 25, from 6 - 7 p.m. at 
the Chelsea Senior Center 
located at 10 Riley Way. 
The event will also be lives-
treamed on Facebook at 
facebook.com/CityOfChel-
sea.

Hosted by the City of 
Chelsea, the information 

session will feature a pan-
el discussion led by 9-1-1 
communication profession-
als from the current Metro 
North RECC and Chelsea’s 
Director of Emergency 
Management Steve Staffier. 
It will also include a Ques-
tion and Answer (Q&A) 
session.

The city has created a 
webpage dedicated to host-
ing information about the 
proposed regionalization 
at chelseama.gov/recc. On 
this page, community mem-
bers can find answers to 
frequently asked questions, 
a proposed budget for the 
new center, a document 
clarifying the operational 
differences between Chel-
sea’s current dispatch oper-
ations and operations in a 
Tier-1 Regional Center, and 
more.

If approved by the City 
Council, the operations 
will be consolidated into 
a shared, state-of-the-art 
RECC designed to enhance 
public safety by improving 
the efficiency and coordina-
tion of emergency dispatch 
services across the three 
communities.

The proposed site for the 
RECC is Revere’s McKin-
ley School — located 1.6 
miles away from Chelsea 
City Hall.

By working together at 
a RECC, the communi-
ties can better respond to 
high-demand periods, re-
duce the burden on indi-
vidual dispatch teams, and 
provide more efficient and 
consistent emergency ser-
vices, according to city of-
ficials. Additional benefits 
to regionalization and infor-
mation can be found at chel-
seama.gov/recc.

CITY TO HOST 
LUNAR NEW YEAR 
CELEBRATION 
SATURDAY

For the first time, a Lunar 
New Year celebration will 
be hosted at the Chelsea 
Public Library on Saturday, 
Feb 15 at 10 a.m.

Windy Pham, author and 
founder of Little Ant World, 
will bring a free celebra-
tion with interactive book 
readings, arts and crafts ac-
tivities, martial arts perfor-
mances, and food tastings 
for all families in Chelsea.

This project is supported 
in part by a Cultural Council 
Grant.

ILLEGAL ALIEN 
SENTENCED TO 
PRISON FOR 
UNLAWFUL 
REENTRY

An El Salvadoran man 
living in Chelsea was sen-
tenced last week in federal 
court in Boston for unlawful 
reentry.

Benancio Martinez-Diaz, 
38, was sentenced by U.S. 
District Court Judge Leo T. 
Sorokin to four months in 
prison, to be followed by 
three years of supervised re-
lease. Martinez-Diaz will be 
subject to deportation upon 
completion of his sentence. 
In October 2024, Marti-
nez-Diaz pleaded guilty to 
one count of unlawful re-
entry. In July 2024, Marti-
nez-Diaz was indicted by 
a federal grand jury in this 
case.

Between 2006 and 2014, 
Martinez-Diaz was deport-
ed/removed from the United 
States on five separate occa-

sions. He was most recently 
removed on or about May 
30, 2014. On or about Oct. 
8, 2023, Martinez-Diaz was 
arrested on state charges and 
Immigration and Customs 
Enforcement was notified 
and a detainer was lodged. 

United States Attorney 
Leah B. Foley; Michael 
J. Krol, Special Agent in 
Charge of Homeland Secu-
rity Investigations in New 
England; and Chelsea Po-
lice Chief Keith Houghton 
made the announcement. 
Assistant U.S. Attorney Su-
zanne Sullivan Jacobus of 
the Major Crimes Unit pros-
ecuted the case.

INDIAN NATIONAL 
SENTENCED FOR 
MAKING FALSE 
STATEMENTS IN AN 
APPLICATION FOR 
A U.S. PASSPORT 
AND TO FEDERAL 
AGENTS

An Indian national living 
in Chelsea was sentenced 
yesterday in federal court 
in Boston for making false 
statements in an application 
for a U.S. passport and mak-
ing false statements to fed-
eral agents.

Sharn Parzival, 25, was 
sentenced by U.S. District 
Judge Richard G. Stearns to 
time served (approximately 
five months) and one year of 
supervised release. Parzival 
is subject to deportation. In 
December 2024, Parzival 
pleaded guilty to an Infor-
mation.

On Jan. 31, 2023, Par-
zival submitted an applica-
tion for a U.S. passport at 
a post office in Somerville, 
Mass. In the application he 
claimed to have been born 
in Maryland and declared 
under penalty of perjury 
that he was a citizen or na-
tional of the United States. 
As proof of identity and 
citizenship, Parzival sub-
mitted copies of a Massa-
chusetts driver’s license 
and a purported Maryland 
birth certificate. The inves-
tigation revealed, however, 
that Parzival had entered the 
country in 2021 from India 
on a non-immigrant student 
Visa but had thereafter been 
expelled by the school he 
was attending. Further in-
vestigation revealed that the 
birth certificate was fraudu-
lent and that Maryland had 
never issued a birth certifi-
cate in Parzival’s name.

On April 26, 2023, Par-
zival went to the office of 
the U.S. Department of State 
(DOS) in Boston to inquire 
about the status of his pass-
port application. He agreed 
to be interviewed by DOS 
agents and made a number 
of false statements, includ-
ing that he had been born in 
Maryland, that he had no af-
filiation with India and that 
he had never applied for a 
Visa. A fingerprint analyst 
subsequently compared 
Parzival’s fingerprints to 
fingerprints that he provided 
when he applied for the Visa 
in India and concluded that 
they matched.

United States Attorney 
Leah B. Foley and Matthew 
O’Brien, Special Agent in 
Charge of U.S. Department 
of State’s Diplomatic Secu-
rity Service, Boston Field 
Office made the announce-
ment. Assistant U.S. Attor-
ney Robert E. Richardson 
of the Major Crimes Unit 
prosecuted the case.

This week marks the 47th anniversary of the Great Blizzard of 1978, which dumped a re-
cord-setting 27 inches of snow on the Boston area, paralyzing the entire region. This photo by 
legendary Chelsea Record photographer Arnie Jarmak captured the scene inside the former 
Beacon Cafe on Lower Broadway, where patrons gathered to ride-out the storm and its after-
math. The Beacon, which was owned at that time by Rose Rudenstein, was a throwback to the 
pre-Prohibition era with its stamped-tin ceiling, weathered wood flooring, dark wood booths, 
tables, and paneling, and classic long mahogany bar.  A copy of the Chelsea Record can be 
seen  in the lower right of the photo. The sign in the upper left notes a beer special for 60 cents.

DO YOU REMEMBER...

Fundraising continues for 
school project on County Road

By Adam Swift

The renovation of the 
First Congregational Church 
at 26 County Road will pro-
vide the school district with 
a new home for the Chelsea 
Opportunity Academy, the 
Intergenerational Literacy 
Program, and the Chelsea 
Virtual Learning Academy.

In addition to serving as 
a new home to those pro-
grams, the project will also 
help create a new focal point 
for the district and commu-
nity as well as open up space 
at the high school and the 
early learning center, ac-
cording to school officials.

At last week’s school 
committee meeting, Ron 
Schmidt provided an update 
on the project. Schmidt is 
the former principal of the 
Chelsea Opportunity Acad-
emy and now serves as the 
project manager for the 
County Road project.

“This is a beautiful church 
that we now own as part 
of the City of Chelsea and 
Chelsea Public Schools, up 
on a hill, majestic both in-
side and out,” said Schmidt. 
“We are incredibly excited 
that this will be the future 
home of the Chelsea Oppor-
tunity Academy, of ILP, and 
the Chelsea Virtual Learning 
Academy.”

Having the three pro-
grams housed in one build-
ing will allow for better 
communication and create 
more space for the entire 
district, he said.

“The Chelsea Opportu-
nity Academy, as of yester-
day, had 150 students and 
is growing and needs the 
space,” said Schmidt.

The academy, which pro-
vides educational opportu-
nities for students most in 
danger of leaving the school 
system, currently uses six 
classrooms at the high 
school.

In addition, the ILP, which 
provides language programs 
for Chelsea residents of 
all ages, is not a good fit at 
the early childhood center, 
Schmidt said.

“Right now, there are 300 
to 400 people on a waiting 
list,” he said. “This will pro-
vide dedicated space where 
they can be installed and 
have their own classrooms 
and deliver everything they 
have.”

The renovations will also 
include office space to have 
everyone from the Chelsea 
Virtual Learning Academy 
in one building.

The renovation plans call 
for three floors of classroom 
and administrative space for 
the three programs, as well 
as areas for food, childcare, 
showering, and other ser-
vices for students in the pro-
grams.

Schmidt noted that about 
80 percent of the Chelsea 
students who are parents at-
tend the Chelsea Opportuni-
ty Academy, and that having 
childcare on site will help 
those students overcome 

some barriers to attendance.
While there will be major 

renovations inside to convert 
the building from a church 
to a school, Schmidt said the 
plan is to keep the four icon-
ic arches with stained glass 
windows inside the building.

“The architects have done 
a beautiful job of preserv-
ing the iconic architecture 
that was designed and built 
over 100 years ago,” he said, 
while also modernizing it 
for use as educational space.

The original renovation 
estimate for the building 
was $10 million, with a $5 
million commitment from 
the city and the school de-
partment.

In addition, the project 
recently received $1 mil-
lion from Bob Hildreth,  the 
founder of La Vida, Inc., In-
versant, Inc., and Hildreth 
Institute, Inc., towards the 
renovations.

“We are on the path of 
meeting with some other 
people who are also capable 
of giving large donations,” 
said Schmidt.

In addition, he said the 
project has a backup plan in 
place for a low-interest loan 
from Metro Credit Union if 
it does not raise the neces-
sary money through dona-
tions.

“This has been a real op-
portunity to bring so many 
people together; we are very 
excited about this build-
ing,” said Superintendent of 
Schools Dr. Almi Abeyta.

have worked with commu-
nity organizations to connect 
families to resources,” said 
Anderson. “I’m excited to 
see this resolution pass.”

Superintendent of Schools 
Dr. Almi Abeyta thanked 
Neville and those who 
worked on the resolution.

“I want everyone to know 
that we care deeply about 
our families and our students 
and that we will ensure the 
privacy of student informa-
tion as stated by the attor-
ney general’s office,” said 
Abeyta. “We will also ensure 
that if ICE (Immigration 
and Customs Enforcement) 
should come to our schools, 

that we will follow the prop-
er procedures as outlined by 
the attorney general.”

Abeyta encouraged par-
ents to continue to send their 
students to school and said 
the schools are safe.

“We want our children in 
school and we believe that 
school is a safe haven, is a 
sanctuary for our students,” 
she said. “Many of our stu-
dents need the services that 
our schools provide …  the 
social aspect of school, we 
learned from the pandem-
ic that school is important 
and we need our children in 
school.”

Neville also discussed the 

importance of making sure 
accurate information is get-
ting out into the community.

“I’ve seen a lot on social 
media, and even some media 
outlets, being irresponsible 
in the way they are spread-
ing information,” said Nev-
ille. “It is important to verify 
the information spreading 
before you share it and try to 
rely on factual things. If we 
are causing panic in the way 
we are spreading informa-
tion, then it does more harm 
than good.

“People need to get to 
work, they need to get to 
school, and we can’t be mak-
ing people afraid to go out.”

School //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

of support and advocacy in 
the city.”

All women and girls in 
Chelsea are encouraged to 
attend and be part of this 
important conversation. For 
more information, please 
contact Devon Fields at 

dfields@chelseama.gov.
The Chelsea Women’s 

Commission (CWC) is 
dedicated to advocating for 
the needs and interests of 
women and girls in Chelsea. 
Through community en-
gagement, research, and pol-

icy recommendations, the 
Commission aims to pro-
mote equity, empowerment, 
and opportunity for all. For 
more information about the 
CWC, visit www.chelsea-
ma.gov/women.

Event //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1
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See ABEYTA Page 3
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SENATOR DIDOMENICO TOURS CHELSEA HIGH SCHOOL

Senator Sal DiDomenico 
recently visited Chelsea High 
School to tour the building 
and learn about the many 
programs the students are of-

fered. This marks one of the 
many visits Senator DiDo-
menico is making to each and 
every K-12 school in his dis-
trict. Education is a top prior-

ity for the Senator and hear-
ing from superintendents, 
teachers, and students about 
what is and isn’t working on 
the ground level is key to in-

forming his legislative efforts 
to support our school system.

“I want to thank Chelsea 
Superintendent, Dr. Almi 
Abeyta, and the staff for host-

ing me,” said Senator Sal 
DiDomenico. “I had the plea-
sure of speaking with Chelsea 
High School students about 
their interests and ideas for 

public education. Many of the 
ideas and policies that I intro-
duce and advocate for are the 
result of hearing and listening 
to our students.”

Senator Sal DiDomenico with Chelsea Superintendent, Dr. 
Almi Abeyta, and Chelsea High School staff.

Senator Sal DiDomenico with Chelsea Superintendent, Dr. Almi Abeyta, and Chelsea High School students and staff.

Senator Sal DiDomenico speaking to a Chelsea High School classroom. Senator Sal DiDomenico touring Chelsea High School with school staff.

Critical and significant drought conditions declared in several regions
Special to the Record

Following nearly six 
months of below-normal 
precipitation, Energy and 
Environmental Affairs 
(EEA) Secretary Rebecca 
Tepper declared the Cen-
tral and Northeast regions 
have been raised to a Lev-
el – 3 Critical Drought. The 
Southeast, Cape and Islands 
regions have been elevated 
to a Level – 2 Significant 
Drought. The Connecticut 
River Valley and Western 
regions still have their pre-
vious statuses: Level 2 – 
Significant and Level – 1 
Mild Drought.  

As outlined in the Mas-
sachusetts Drought Man-
agement Plan, a Level 3 – 
Critical Drought, Level – 2 
Significant Drought, and a 
Level – 1 Mild Drought re-
quire detailed monitoring of 
drought conditions. These 
levels also require ongoing 
coordination among state 
and federal agencies to im-
plement water use restric-

tions. Additionally, engage-
ment with municipalities, 
including local Boards of 
Health, is essential. This in-
cludes providing technical 
outreach and assistance to 
water suppliers and affected 
municipalities. 

“Even with winter weath-
er, several regions in our 
state are facing below-av-
erage precipitation,” said 
EEA Secretary Rebecca 
Tepper. “To avoid overtax-
ing our water systems, we 
must prioritize indoor water 
conservation. It’s essential 
that everyone follows state 
guidance and  local water 
restrictions to ensure our 
drinking water stays avail-
able for everyone.” 

Over the past month, 
most of the state received 
between 1-2.5 inches of rain 
and snow, which is 1-13 
inches below normal. Over-
all, most of the state has 
been in an 8-13 inch deficit 
since August. The Cape and 
Islands region is experienc-
ing a 3.8-6 inch deficit in 

precipitation. Despite the 
recent rain and snowfall, 
streamflow and groundwa-
ter have worsened in near-
ly all regions, and recharge 
that typically occurs at this 
time of the year to reservoirs 
and groundwater lagging. 
Residents can report dry en-
vironmental conditions they 
are experiencing and sub-
mit photos to support state 
drought monitoring efforts 
here. 

The Massachusetts De-
partment of Environmental 
Protection (MassDEP) will 
continue to provide tech-
nical assistance to commu-
nities on managing their 
water systems, including 
assistance on the use of 
emergency connections and 
water supplies. 

It is important to note that 
the Massachusetts Water Re-
sources Authority (MWRA) 
water supply system is not 
experiencing drought con-
ditions, as defined within its 
individual plan. However, 
private well users and oth-

Region Drought Level 
Declaration Previous Month 

Western Level 1 – Mild Drought Level 1 – Mild Drought

Connecticut River Valley Level 2 – Significant 
Drought

Level 2 – Significant 
Drought

Central Level 3 – Critical 
Drought

Level 2 – Significant 
Drought

Northeast Level 3 – Critical 
Drought

Level 2 – Significant 
Drought

Southeast Level 2 – Significant 
Drought Level 1 – Mild Drought

Cape Cod Level 2 – Significant 
Drought Level 1 – Mild Drought

Islands Level 2 – Significant 
Drought Level 1 – Mild Drought

er sources of water within 
the same river basins are 
impacted by drought condi-
tions. All sources of water, 
regardless of their location 
or type of withdrawal, ulti-
mately draw from the same 
river basin. It is important 

for all users to do their part 
to conserve water. 

Below are recommen-
dations for communities 
and individuals living and 
working within a Level 3 – 
Critical Drought, Level 2 – 
Significant Drought,

 and Level 1 – Mild 
Drought region, including 
those utilizing a private 
well. Residents and busi-
nesses are also asked to 
check with their local water 

See DROUGHT Page 4
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system in case more strin-
gent watering restrictions 
are in place. 
For Regions in Level 3 – 

Critical Drought 
Residents and Business-

es: 
• Minimize overall water 

use;
• Follow state water con-

servation actions and any 
local water use restrictions;

• Monitor total house-
hold water use shown on 
your water bill for sudden 
increases, which often in-
dicate leaks. Use the MA 
Home Water Use Calculator 
tool  to evaluate household 
water use;

• Fix any toilet or faucet 
leaks immediately. Check 
for leaks in homes and busi-
nesses regularly by:

 Checking water meters 
for constant dial movement

 Using dye tabs to check 
for toilet leaks 

 Conducting regular in-
spections of all pipes and 
fixtures, including those 
located in utility rooms, 
crawlspaces, and other hid-
den areas 

• Use dishwashers rather 
than handwashing dishes. 
Run the dishwasher only on 
a full load; 

• Aggressively reduce in-
door water use by:

 Reducing shower length 
and consider using a shower 
timer

 Running washing ma-
chines only on a full load

 Not letting water run 
while brushing and shaving

 Replacing old fixtures 
and appliances with wa-
ter-efficient ones. Make 
sure toilets, faucets, and 
showerheads are Water-
Sense labeled  

• Stop all non-essential 
water use; and,

• Be extra cautious with 
outdoor fires, grills, and 
flammable materials.

Immediate Steps for 
Communities/Municipali-

ties: 
• Provide timely infor-

mation on the drought and 
on water conservation tips 
to local residents and busi-
nesses taking advantage of 
the state’s library of out-
reach materials; 

• Enforce water use re-
strictions with increasingly 
stringent penalties; 

• Strongly discourage or 
prohibit washing of hard 
surfaces (sidewalks, patios, 
driveways, siding); person-
al vehicle or boat washing; 
and, 

• Establish or enhance 
water-use reduction targets 
for all water users, identify 
top water users and conduct 
targeted outreach to help 
curb their use.  

Short- and Medium-Term 
Steps for Communities/Mu-
nicipalities: 

• Establish a year-round 
water conservation program 
that includes public educa-
tion and communication, 
taking advantage of the 
state’s library of outreach 
materials; 

• Implement or establish 
drought surcharge or sea-
sonal water rates; 

• Prepare to activate 
emergency inter-connec-
tions for water supply; and, 

• Develop or refine your 
local drought management 
plan using guidance out-
lined in the state Drought 
Management Plan.
For Regions in Level 2 – 

Significant Drought  
Residents and Business-

es: 
• Minimize overall wa-

ter use and be particularly 
mindful of indoor water 
use;

• Follow local water use 
restrictions;

• Fix indoor leaks, such 
as from toilets, faucets, and 
showers, which result in 
more than 60 percent of in-
door use;

• For larger buildings and 

businesses, conduct water 
audits to identify areas of 
leaks and potential water 
conservation opportunities. 

Immediate Steps for 
Communities/Municipali-
ties: 

• Limit or prohibit wash-
ing of hard surfaces (side-
walks, patios, driveways, 
siding); personal vehicle or 
boat washing. 

• Establish water-use re-
duction targets for all water 
users, identify top water 
users and conduct targeted 
outreach to help curb their 
use. 

Short- and Medium-Term 
Steps for Communities/Mu-
nicipalities: 

• Establish a year-round 
water conservation program 
that includes public educa-
tion and communication, 
taking advantage of the 
state’s library of outreach 
materials;

• Provide timely informa-
tion to local residents and 
businesses;

• Implement or establish 
drought surcharge or sea-
sonal water rates; and,

• Check emergency in-
ter-connections for water 
supply; and,

• Develop or refine your 
local drought management 
plan using guidance out-
lined in the state Drought 
Management Plan.  

Below are recommen-
dations for communities 
and individuals living and 
working within a Level 1 – 
Mild Drought region.  

For Region in Level 1 – 
Mild Drought   

 Residents and Business-
es:

• Minimize overall water 
use; 

• Fix indoor leaks, such 
as from toilets, faucets, and 
showers, which result in 
more than 60 percent of in-
door use; and,

• For larger buildings and 
businesses, conduct water 
audits to identify areas of 
leaks and potential water 
conservation opportunities.

Communities/Municipal-
ities:  

• Establish a year-round 
water conservation pro-
gram that includes public 
education and communi-
cation, taking advantage of 
the state’s library of out-
reach materials;

• Provide timely drought 
and water conservation in-
formation to local residents 
and businesses; 

• Check emergency in-
ter-connections for water 
supply; and,

• Develop a local drought 
management plan (learn 
more here).  

State agencies will con-
tinue to closely monitor and 
assess conditions across the 
state, coordinate any need-
ed dissemination of infor-
mation

 to the public, and help 
federal, state, and local 
agencies prepare addition-
al responses that may be 
needed in the future. The 
Drought Management Task 
Force will meet again on 
Thursday, March 6,  at 
10:00AM. For further infor-
mation on water conserva-
tion and what residents can 
do, visit the EEA’s drought  
and water conservation  
pages.
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TRAFFIC SPEED CAMERAS ARE 

A BAD IDEA -- RED LIGHTS 
ARE BETTER

As our regular readers know, when it comes to the issue 
of motor vehicle safety, we take a back seat (pun intended) 
to no one.

However, we believe that the budget put forward by Gov. 
Maura Healey that would allow local and state authorities 
to place traffic speed cameras on our roadways is misguid-
ed.

In a nutshell, the legislation provides that tickets for $25 
may be issued to persons operating 11 miles or more over 
the speed limit and $100 to those driving more than 25 over 
the limit. A first offense within any two-year period would 
result in a warning. In addition, the tickets would not go 
on a person’s driving record for insurance purposes. They 
would essentially be the same as a parking ticket. 

Our objections are as follows:
First, state law requires that, absent exigent circumstanc-

es, a police officer must issue a citation for a moving in-
fraction at the time and place of the violation. This ensures 
that the officer is giving the citation to the person who is 
committing the violation. However, the traffic cameras only 
will be capturing a license plate, which means that the tick-
et will be sent to the registered owner without regard to 
whether the owner was actually the operator of the vehicle. 
If your child (or spouse, friend, or somebody else) is speed-
ing in your car, you’re stuck with the ticket and the hassle 
of trying to prove your innocence.

Second, local authorities (who are limited to installing 
one camera per 5000 of population in their communities) 
presumably will be installing these cameras on their most 
heavily-traveled roadways. However, this invariably means 
that non-residents, who may not be familiar with the speed 
limit on those roads, will be the ones who will be subject to 
getting a ticket. This will be doubly true because the speed 
limits on almost every local road in this state are poor-
ly-marked and often change (up or down) without warning. 
In some communities, there is a discreet sign at the entrance 
to the town that the speed limit in that community is 25 
m.p.h. “unless posted otherwise.” Given the scattershot na-
ture of speed limit postings across the state’s 351 cities and 
towns, issuing speeding tickets based on a camera will be 
inherently unfair and arbitrary.

Third, the cameras will not deter those drivers who are 
the real problem: Habitual traffic offenders who speed ex-
cessively on a routine basis. In fact, the cameras will give 
them a green light (again, pun intended) to speed. If the 
tickets under the new system will have no real consequenc-
es for either their license or their insurance premiums, these 
habitual offenders will be able to drive as they like with 
impunity. For the juvenile-minded members of the Fast 
and Furious crowd, the ticket will not even be a slap on the 
wrist.

And that brings us to our fourth problem with the new 
law: Relying on traffic cameras to enforce the traffic laws 
on the main roads in our state will make our roadways less 
safe. Traffic stops by police officers do not merely deter 
unsafe drivers, but they also remove from our roads per-
sons who have suspended licenses, court warrants, vehicles 
that are unregistered and uninsured, and drivers who are 
under the influence -- 40 percent of speeding drivers in fa-
tal crashes had a blood alcohol content of 0.08 percent or 
above. A camera will address none of those issues -- leav-
ing criminals and those under the influence to operate on 
our roads without fear of the possible consequences. 

More broadly, if communities take the cheap way out, 
so to speak, by replacing officers with cameras, the entire 
community will be a lot less safe. We realize that every city 
and town in the state will soon be facing major budget is-
sues and that many cities also are having a hard time filling 
the ranks of their police departments, but there is no substi-
tute for having police officers patrolling our streets. In our 
view, if these cameras begin to replace police officers, our 
communities will be far less safe.

Finally, there is no doubt that most of these speed cam-
era tickets will be issued to otherwise law-abiding and safe 
drivers, including many seniors, who might happen to ex-
ceed by a few miles the statutory threshold for a few sec-
onds. We are being only semi-facetious in suggesting that 
drivers who obsessively are watching their speedometers 
and looking for changes in speed limit signs will add im-
measurably to the plague of distracted driving. Driving 11 
miles over the speed limit on most of our roadways is not 
unsafe, but the new law would punish normal everyday 
driving behavior.

But we have a better suggestion: If our state officials 
want to introduce traffic cameras, we think they should do 
so at red light intersections. More than 1100 persons nation-
wide, of whom half were pedestrians and bicyclists, were 
killed (and more than 100,000 were injured) in 2022 by 
motor vehicle operators who ran red lights. Statistics show 
that red light cameras reduce serious accidents of the hor-
rific “T-bone” variety by 25 percent (although there is some 
evidence that rear-end accidents may increase). 

Large, clear signage at every red light intersection pro-
claiming that cameras are in use would be a huge deterrent 
to anyone who might be tempted to run a red light (i.e., 
every driver on the road). 

In addition, by requiring that communities must conform 
the light signalizations on their local roads to nationally-ac-
cepted standards, this will make intersections safer for ev-
erybody.

So we urge our legislators, if they are inclined to intro-
duce traffic cameras in Massachusetts, to allow these devic-
es to be placed at red light intersections in order to achieve 
the goal of improving roadway safety with the least amount 
of intrusion upon everyday, law-abiding citizens.
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not just a slogan; it’s not just 
a plan; it is a declaration of 
our commitment to prog-
ress, growth, innovation, 
and inclusivity. I am pleased 
to report our City’s finances 
are stronger than ever. 

This fall, we received a 
clean financial audit and 
reviewed the findings with 
our City Council. We suc-
cessfully closed out Fiscal 
Year 2024 and generated 
over $33 Million in Free 
Cash. Funds we will use to 
complete major capital im-
provements and to replenish 
our rainy day accounts. Our 
annual comprehensive fi-
nancial report was awarded 
the Certificate of Achieve-
ment for the 26th consec-
utive year. S&P Global af-
firmed the City’s AA bond 
rating and confirmed our 
stable outlook. We also 
modernized our finance op-
erations, including rolling 
out our employee self-ser-
vice portal and eliminating 
wasteful printing practices. 
Our Finance team, led by 
Michael Mason, are laser 
focused on ensuring that 
our City’s finances remain 
strong, while continuing to 
provide excellent municipal 
services to our residents. 

While we are proud that 
our finances are strong, we 
know that uncertain finan-
cial times are ahead of us. 
We will not let our success 
blind us into unsustainable 
budgeting. We will rebuild 
reserves that will see us 
through the next downturn, 
whenever it may come. We 
owe this to our employees 
and to our residents. 

Our efforts to improve 
communication between 
the City and its residents 
have paid off. In collabora-
tion with Chelsea Commu-
nity Cable, we launched a 
monthly series called Our 
Community and hired a 
rockstar communications 
manager, Lily Martin. We 
launched a weekly news-
letter called the City News 
and activated Downtown 
Broadway Project an-
nouncements and a traffic 
advisory information page. 
In the last quarter of 2024, 
our online engagement has 
skyrocketed, with Facebook 
and Instagram reaching new 
audiences. In 2024, we did 
more than just connect on-
line. We brought people 
together in person. We part-
nered with our Chelsea Po-
lice Department and local 
houses of worship to hold 
many Faith & Blue events. 
These gatherings fostered 
stronger community bonds 
and encouraged meaningful 
dialogue between residents 
and law enforcement. We 
held listening sessions with 
over 20 local organizations. 
These conversations were 
critical in getting City Hall 
into the community, lis-
tening to those that matter 
most, our community lead-
ers and our residents.

  We are excited to an-
nounce that in 2025 we will 
host those listening sessions 
again. Chelsea is more con-
nected than ever, and as we 
move forward, we will con-
tinue to explore new ways 
to engage and inform as 
many residents as possible. 

The City Council took 
a significant step forward 
in 2024 by establishing the 
Chelsea Women’s Com-
mission. This Commission 
is an intentional, dedicated 
group focused on advanc-
ing the wellbeing of women 
and girls in our community. 
The Commission has hosted 
monthly public meetings, 
engaged with Chelsea wom-
en and girls at key commu-
nity events and surveyed 
residents to inform the cre-
ation of a comprehensive 
Women’s Resource Guide. 

In 2024 we launched 
Chelsea Electricity Choice, 
our municipal aggregation 
program, which provides 

our residents and small 
business owners with more 
stable and competitive elec-
tricity prices. In fact, Chel-
sea Electricity Choice offers 
some of the most compet-
itive rates in the greater 
Boston area. This program 
brings significant savings 
and the rates are locked in 
for 24 months, and are not 
subject to seasonal or po-
litical swings. reducing fi-
nancial uncertainty around 
energy costs. 

Over the past year, we 
have also strengthened our 
efforts to hold bad landlords 
accountable. We heard loud 
and clear that the City has 
to fight for our residents. To 
do this, we formed a Hous-
ing Task Force, bringing 
together staff from Housing 
and Community Develop-
ment, Inspectional Services, 
the Law Department, Police 
and Fire. This team has been 
focused on finding practical 
solutions to Chelsea’s hous-
ing challenges and ensuring 
that our residents are pro-
tected. This group operates 
with a ‘boots on the ground’ 
approach to problem prop-
erties. Most recently, we 
created a new licensing 
process to hold property 
management companies 
accountable. In partnership 
with La Colaborativa, we 
supported free eviction de-
fense for Chelsea residents, 
and hosted weekly Legal 
Housing Clinics at the Sur-
vival Center on Sixth Street. 
In the next few months we 
will launch Made App, a 
free, self-guided web tool 
that helps tenants prepare 
for eviction cases. We will 
continue empowering our 
residents and ensuring they 
have the resources they 
need to stay in their homes. 
La Colaborativa has been an 
invaluable ally in our work 
to tackle the housing crisis 
in Chelsea. 

We have also seen a sig-
nificant increase to our 
affordable housing stock 
this past year thanks to in-
novative public and private 
developments. We cele-
brated the grand opening 
of the DUO Apartments 
on Central Avenue, a $155 
million transformation-
al development that built 
330 mixed-income housing 
units. DUO replaced 96 
units of aging public hous-
ing with brand new, energy 
efficient and ADA acces-
sible affordable units. We 
are proud to have partnered 
with the Chelsea Housing 
Authority and private devel-
opers to bring this project to 
fruition. The Neighborhood 
Developers also developed 
56 affordable rental apart-
ments and 6 affordable 
homeownership units at 25 
Sixth Street. The project re-
developed an underutilized 
industrial site next to the 

Silver Line supporting our 
vision for transit oriented 
development. 

Chelsea continues to 
grow, and we are committed 
to making sure affordabili-
ty is part of that growth. In 
the fall we announced the 
launch of our Opioid Abate-
ment Grant Program made 
possible by the Statewide 
Opioid Settlement cases. I 
am pleased to share that we 
have awarded significant 
grants to Roca and CAPIC, 
which will be paid out over 
the next three years. Addi-
tionally, our Micro Grant 
Program will provide up 
to $2,500 to local groups 
through Fiscal Year 2038. A 
portion of these funds will 
also support Chelsea Po-
lice’s Critical Incident Man-
agement System enabling 
the sharing of non-fatal 
drug overdose data across 
communities. I want to ex-
press my gratitude to Dan 
Cortez, Flor Amaya, Tracy 
Nowicki and Devon Fields 
for their work with opioid 
funds. Their dedication to 
tackling one of our commu-
nity’s most pressing chal-
lenges has been nothing 
short of extraordinary. 

This year we also cre-
ated our Lead Task Force. 
The task force is raising 
awareness about the dan-
gers of lead and working 
to eliminate lead service 
lines in Chelsea’s water sys-
tem. Over the past year, our 
Task Force created a ded-
icated webpage; partnered 
with Clean Water Action 
and GreenRoots to enhance 
community outreach and 
education; Knocked on 
over 1,000 doors, engag-
ing directly with residents 
and booked more than 300 
service line inspection ap-
pointments. While we are 
pleased that over 200 lead 
service lines have been re-
placed, and more than 3,000 
safe copper lines have been 
confirmed, our goal is clear: 
we will eliminate lead from 
Chelsea’s water system 
and will ensure that every 
resident has access to safe 
drinking water. 

Public safety is always 
top of mind in our com-
munity. We are proud to 
announce that in 2024, the 
Safe Streets Task Force, 
a partnership between the 
Chelsea Police Department 
and the FBI, made signifi-
cant progress in dismantling 
gang leadership and reduc-
ing gang activity. Through 
Operation Eight Ball, the 
task force disrupted or-
ganized crime, leading to 
significant arrests and the 
seizure of weapons, cur-
rency, and property. The 
Downtown Task Force, a 
collaboration with Chelsea 
Police, local businesses, and 
service providers, also saw 
success. Thanks to proactive 
efforts, we have reduced 
graffiti, public drinking, 
and criminal activity in our 
downtown. The Chelsea Po-
lice-led HUB initiative con-
tinued to address complex 
social issues by offering 
coordinated interventions. 
In 2024, the HUB provid-
ed resources to over 1,000 
residents, improving safety 
and strengthening commu-
nity trust. Finally, our Po-
lice Department launched a 
Female Officer Enrichment 

Program to empower our 
female officers with leader-
ship skills in decision-mak-
ing, crisis management, and 
community engagement, 
paving the way for a more 
inclusive leadership team in 
the department. Thank you 
Chief Houghton and the 
men and women of our Po-
lice Department for serving 
and protecting our commu-
nity around the clock. 

This past year, the Chel-
sea Fire Department wel-
comed Fire Chief John 
Quatieri. Under his lead-
ership, collaboration and 
innovation have flourished, 
particularly with the launch 
of our SafetyNet Tracking 
Program. This program 
equips individuals with a 
tracker bracelet, allowing 
emergency personnel to 
locate them quickly when 
they are reported missing. 
Last month, the program 
was successfully road-test-
ed when a missing child 
with autism was located 
within 20 minutes. This fall, 
the Fire Department also 
introduced a Fire Safety 
Education Program to teach 
residents and local groups 
critical fire prevention tech-
niques. This includes in-per-
son visits from the Fire Pre-
vention team and tours of 
the Central Fire Station. In 
addition to these impressive 
efforts, the Fire Department 
responded to 13 working 
fires in 2024, including 8 
multiple alarm fires. Multi-
ple alarm fires involve large 
and fast-spreading blazes, 
demanding backup teams, 
and mutual aid from neigh-
boring cities to extinguish 
the fire safely. I am grateful 
for the heroic efforts of our 
firefighters. 

As the saying goes, “Not 
all heroes wear capes.” And 
this past year, we celebrated 
the heroic actions of sever-
al firefighters. Lieutenant 
Omar Frometa, Firefighters 
Jamal Ahmed, Andrew Cer-
retani, and Christian Avel-
laneda were recognized for 
their bravery in rescuing 
two colleagues from a burn-
ing building. Firefighter Jeff 
Flores was recognized for 
saving lives while off duty, 
and Firefighter Euclides 
Barahona was honored for 
rescuing three occupants 
from a fire. Finally, Fire-
fighter Miguel Acosta was 
recognized for performing 
life-saving CPR after a mo-
tor vehicle accident. We are 
also proud of our invest-
ments in infrastructure and 
sustainability. 

In December, we 
launched our solar-pow-
ered microgrid project that 
will help us become more 
energy independent and 
resilient. This initiative is 
part of our broader strategy 
to protect the city’s essen-
tial services and ensure the 
safety of our most vulnera-
ble residents. Our microgrid 
project would not have been 
possible without the invalu-
able support of GreenRoots. 

We also made significant 
progress on the Downtown 
Broadway Project, a $30 
million investment trans-
forming our city’s down-
town with new roads, utili-
ties, and pedestrian-friendly 
spaces. This project will 
make our downtown more 
accessible, vibrant, and wel-

coming. We look forward to 
completing Phase 1 of this 
project and beginning Phase 
2. In 2024, the City contin-
ued our Storefront Improve-
ment program, investing 
$100,000 to enhance the 
storefronts of local busi-
nesses while supporting the 
local economy. Six busi-
nesses, including Lope-
sa, Pupusas Las Delicias, 
and M&Y Jewelry, each 
received grants for store-
front improvements, along 
with technical assistance 
from the Chelsea Chamber 
of Commerce. A special 
thanks to Omar Miranda 
and the Chamber of Com-
merce for their partnership 
in this effort. 

Art and culture play a 
crucial role in shaping the 
identity and vibrancy of our 
community. It enriches the 
daily lives of our residents, 
attracts visitors, supports 
local businesses, and spurs 
economic development. 
This year we hired our first 
dedicated Arts and Culture 
Manager, Lourdes Alvarez. 
This role will amplify our 
city’s cultural offerings, 
foster artistic collaboration, 
and create programs that en-
gage residents and visitors 
alike. In 2024 we focused 
on enhancing our parks and 
open spaces to improve our 
community’s wellbeing. 
We hired our first Park and 
Open Space Manager, Blad-
imir Hernandez. Bladimir 
will manage all municipal 
parks, trees, and open spaces 
and oversee grants for park 
improvements and ADA 
upgrades. We took an un-
derused lot and transformed 
it into Forsyth Pocket Park, 
a vibrant space with a patio, 
umbrellas, shade trees, na-
tive plants, and improved 
drainage. We renovated 
Bosson Park, which now 
has shaded lawns, new seat-
ing, new play equipment, 
a picnic area with a splash 
pad, a new basketball court, 
and, thanks to our dedicat-
ed DPW staff, dozens of 
healthy shade trees. Lastly, 
Highland Park underwent 
major upgrades and now 
features a new synthetic 
turf soccer field, improved 
drainage and bleachers. 

I’d like to give a special 
shout out to Ben Cares, Em-
ily Granoff, and the entire 
Housing & Community De-
velopment team. Your work 
fosters a healthier, more 
connected environment 
where residents can gather, 
play, and thrive together. In 
response to the communi-
ty’s call for a greater focus 
on youth sports, we hired 
Charlie Giuffrida as our Di-
rector of Athletic Infrastruc-
ture and Sports Tourism. 
Charlie has connected our 
leagues, coaches, and play-
ers to invaluable resources, 
including new sources of 
funding, equipment, and 
expertise. He has taken a 

community-first approach, 
meeting with hundreds of 
students, parents, and stake-
holders to create programs 
that truly reflect Chelsea’s 
needs and aspirations. 

I am pleased to report that 
the City’s relationship with 
Chelsea Public Schools is 
stronger than ever. Under 
the excellent leadership of 
Superintendent Dr. Almi 
Abeyta, Chelsea Public 
Schools continues to serve 
all students, including our 
most underserved popu-
lations. In 2024, the City 
purchased a vacant church, 
which, once renovated, 
will house the Chelsea Op-
portunity Academy and 
the Intergenerational Lit-
eracy Program, freeing up 
much-needed space at our 
Chelsea High School and 
the Early Learning Center. 
Over the summer, we ren-
ovated the Chelsea High 
School Cafeteria, expand-
ing its seating capacity and 
kitchen space, resulting in a 
significantly improved stu-
dent dining experience. We 
look forward to continuing 
to support Chelsea students 
from “cradle to career” in 
partnership with our Super-
intendent Almi Abeyta and 
the dedicated Chelsea Pub-
lic Schools staff. 

While there is uncer-
tainty surrounding national 
policy, please rest assured 
that Chelsea will continue 
to protect the dignity and 
rights of every resident. We 
will continue to work with 
our legal partners so resi-
dents can understand their 
rights and protections un-
der Massachusetts law. I am 
proud of the diverse com-
munity we have built here 
in Chelsea. We are stronger 
because of our immigrant 
population, and we will not 
let fear or misinformation 
divide us. I am confident 
that together we will over-
come these challenges. We 
have done it before. We 
are a city of resilience, of 
strength, and of determina-
tion. This is the spirit that 
drives us onward–Chelsea 
Pa’Lante. In this spirit, we 
recorded the State of the 
City in Spanish, and it will 
be made available after this 
meeting by Chelsea Com-
munity Cable via Youtube. 

Thank you for your con-
tinued partnership and for 
your dedication to the City 
of Chelsea. Thank you City 
Council for your continued 
support and engagement. 
Thank you to our staff and 
our community partners 
who continue to grow, in-
novate, and build a bright-
er future for us all. 2025 
will bring us even greater 
achievements, and we will 
continue to honor our past 
while shaping a prosperous 
future. Thank you and May 
god bless the City of Chel-
sea.

Combo Rates available!  
Buy any 3 sites, get 4th FREE

Clients and Customers 
are just a click away! 

$30000 per month
 per site 

Extend your Business’s reach 
with Online Advertising!

AD SIZE
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H: 600px

——————

please send 
in “png”
format

reverejournal.com •winthroptranscript.com 
lynnjournal.com • everettindependent.com 

eastietimes.com • chelsearecord.com 
charlestownbridge.com • beaconhilltimes.com

northendregionalreview.com • thebostonsun.com

jamaicaplaingazette.com • missionhillgazette.com

INDEPENDENT
THE
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Call 781-485-0588 to get started!

Milestones //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

Jeff@jeffreybowen.com  781-201-9488

Serving  buyers, sellers, 
and landlords since 2001.

Real Estate Transfers
BUYER 1	  SELLER 1	 ADDRESS                  PRICE   

Masucci, Michael	 Burge, Michael W      	 4 Medford St                 	 $347,500  

Vazquez, Janice	 78 Englewood LLC	 80 Englewood Ave #1   	 $800,000  

City Manager Fidel Maltez
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SIMON, RAMIREZ-
VILLATA ARE GBL 
CHAMPIONS

Chelsea High sopho-
more Thania Simon won 
two GBL titles and senior 
Kiara Ramirez-Villata won 
another  at last Monday’s 
Greater Boston League 
(GBL) Championship Meet 
that was held at the Reggie 
Lewis Athletic Center in 
Roxbury.

Thania sprinted to vic-
tories in both of the dash 
events. She took first place 
in the 55 meter dash with a 
time of 7.56 seconds and in 
the 300m with a clocking of 
43.41. Thania also took sec-
ond place in the long jump 
with a leap of 15’-4” to 
score 28 points for the Lady 
Red Devils.

Ramirez-Villata won the 
shot-put in convincing fash-
ion. Kiara’s throw of 34’-0” 

was more than five feet fur-
ther than the second-place 
girl.

Sophomore Lilly Serra-
no turned in a superlative 
performance  in the meet, 
scoring 6.25  points in three 
events with a fifth-place ef-
fort in the 55m dash in 7.95, 
a fourth-place in the 300m 
in 5.96, and running a leg of 
the sixth-place 4 x 200 relay 
team.

Also adding points to 
the CHS total and bringing 
home medals were: Angely 
Meia-Martinez with a fifth 
in the shot-put with a throw 
of 25’-6” and Hazel Hatle-
berg with a sixth in both the 
1000 in a time of 3:42.97 
and the two-mile with a 
clocking of 15:13.64.

The 4 x 200 relay team of 
Lilly Serrano, Ashly Damas 
Ruiz, Emelin Rosales, and 
Ashley Gomes earned sixth 
place medals with a time 

of 2:06.61, as did the 4 x 
400 relay team of  Kather-
ine Benitez, Cesia Flores, 
Emelin Rosales, and Ashly 
Damas Ruiz   in a clocking 
of 5:10.2.

The Lady Red Devils tal-
lied 50 points to finish in the 
top half of the eight-team 
GBL table   behind Revere 
(124 points), Somerville 
(106 points), and Medford 
(55 points) and ahead

of Lynn English, Everett, 
Malden, and Lynn Classi-
cal.

Members of the  team 
who qualified  will com-
pete in the Division 3 State 
Meet tomorrow (Friday) at 
the Reggie Lewis Center.

BOYS 4 X 400 TEAM
IS GBL CHAMPION

The Chelsea High 4 x 

CHS GIRLS BASKETBALL FALLS TO MYSTIC VALLEY REGIONAL CHARTER SCHOOL

CHS Roundup

See ROUNDUP Page 11

Chelsea’s two-game win streak was snapped in a 56-30 loss to Mystic Valley Regional 
Charter School in girls basketball competition Friday night at Chelsea High. 

Taylor Solano (10) plays close defense and blocks a shot by a MV forward.

Fatuma Iman, (14) and Jolaynnie Zayas (21, obscured) put a stop to a Mystic Valley offensive 
effort.

 Monica Cespedes-Cruz (1) looks for a path to the basket. Monica Cespedes-Crus (1) looks one way and passes another

Fatuma Iman (14), Melize Siliro (0), and Jolaynnie Zayas  (21) reach for a rebound.

 Jess Bayarsakhan  (7) looks for an outlet as she is double-teamed in the corner.

Jess Bayarsakhan(7) gets control of a rebound.

BOB MARRA PHOTOS
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Hockey fans will likely 
suffer withdrawal effects 
the next two weeks, as the 
NHL regular schedule is 
paused. There is a cure for 
that ailment, it is the 4 Na-
tions Face-Off, instead of 
an All-Star Weekend, which 
will feature teams of NHL 
players representing the 
four nations of, Canada, 
Finland, Sweden and the 
United States facing off in 
Montreal and Boston. The 
tournament will consist of a 
total of seven games played 
over a nine-day period from 
February 12th to February 
20th. Four games will be 
played at the Bell Centre in 
Montreal, and three games, 
including the championship 
match, at Boston’s TD Gar-
den in Boston. All games 
will be played in accor-
dance with NHL rules. Each 
team will play three tourna-
ment games in a traditional 
Round Robin format, under 
the following points system: 
3 points for a win in regu-
lation time; 2 points for a 
win in overtime/shootout; 1 
point for a loss in overtime/
shootout; and 0 points for 
a loss in regulation time. 
The two teams with the best 
tournament record will then 
advance to a one-game Fi-
nal.

The tournament begins 
in Montreal tomorrow 
night (Wednesday Feb. 12) 
at 8:00pm, with host Team 
Canada facing Team Swe-

den. 

The 
s e c -
ond match will have Team 
USA taking on Team Fin-
land on Thursday (Feb. 13), 
also at 8:00pm. Saturday 
(Feb. 15) will feature a pair 
of games, beginning with 
Team Finland battling Team 
Sweden in a 1:00pm mati-
nee, and the second half of 
the pairing will have Team 
USA matching up against 
Team Canada at 8:00pm. 
Bruins players on Team 
USA will be goaltender Jer-
emy Swayman and defense-
man Charlie McAvoy. Team 
Canada’s roster will include 
Bruins captain Brad March-
and, and Elias Lindholm 
will appear on Team Swe-
den’s roster.

The remaining three 
games, including the Cham-
pionship Game, will be 
held at TD Garden. The 
opening contests will have 
the remainder of the games 
that will determine the two 
teams with the most points. 
Team Canada and Team 
Finland will begin the pro-
ceedings on Monday (Feb. 
17), in a 1:00pm matinee, 
and the 8:00pm contest will 
have Team Sweden and 
Team USA battling to deter-

mine a winner. The Cham-
pionship Game will be held 
on Thursday (Feb. 20), with 

the two teams with the 
most points will play for 

the 4 Nations Face-Off 
Trophy.

Men’s Beanpot trophy 
won by Boston University

Cole Hutson scored what 
proved to be the game-win-
ning goal, as Boston Uni-
versity bounced back from 
a one-goal deficit to down 
number one ranked Bos-
ton College by a score of 
4-1, earning BU their 32nd 
Beanpot win. Hutson was 
rewarded with tournament 
MVP honors for his night’s 
work. On a night with many 
highlights, including excel-
lent performances by both 
goaltenders, Boston College 
net minder Jacob Fowler (40 
saves) and Boston Universi-
ty’s freshman puck stopper 
Mikhail Yegorov (43 saves) 
in a stalwart effort. Several 
solid penalty kills, and Bos-
ton University ended the 
night with a 200-foot empty 
net goal by Gavin McCa-
rthy to put the final nail ii 
Boston College’s coffin.

Boston College scored 
first to take the lead early in 
the game, Boston University 
tied it up at 5:43 on a Boston 
College turnover.  The Ter-
riers added to their lead  just 
over a minute later, as Hut-
son fired a wrist shot that 

FORMERLY EAST BOSTON NEIGHBORHOOD HEALTH CENTER

617-568-4781

Refill prescriptions online via MyChart 

Home delivery 

Friendly, helpful staff 

Short wait times 

Pharmacies at 10 Gove St. and Maverick Square

Pick up your prescriptions – 
or get them delivered!

neighborhealth.com

BEANPOT AND MORE...
BRUINS Beat  by Bob Morello

Special to the Record

Held at the Omni  Hotel 
Boston Seaport on Thurs-
day, January 30, the Annu-
al Dinner celebration finale 
was a performance by the 
Boys and Girls Club of 
Boston (BGCB) Clubhouse 
Band, with a young soloist 
from the Gerald and Dar-
lene Jordan Club of Chel-
sea. The young fellow with 
great stage presence and a 
voice and dance moves to 
match singing Pharrel Wil-
iams’ Happy  song had the 
more than 900 attendees 
leaping out of their seats to 
sing along and groove with 
the young performer. 

This final act was an apt 
ending to a festive and com-
pelling evening of both ku-
dos for its current successes 
and new challenges for the 
Boys & Girls Club for our 
city and its neighborhoods.   
The evening’s theme of 
Transforming Tomorrow 
showcased the Club’s more 
recent focus on expanding 
services for their teen mem-
bers. As one Board member 
explained members join as 
kids and stay, so we need 
to provide opportunities 
for them across their stay 
with us.  Dinner Co-chairs 
Thomas N. O’Brien and 
Kendalle Burlin O’Connell, 
along with Board Chair 
Melissa Weiner Janfazza, 

underscored the need for 
both internships from local 
companies and contribu-
tions for those internships.  
The high energy format of 
the program was a late night 
talk show type set up, think 
Johnny Carson or David 
Letterman style interviews, 
nicely delivered by co-
hosts, Rick Aggeler, Execu-
tive Director of Teen Strate-
gy  for the overall Club, and 
Tea, a long-standing now 
high school member of the 
Josh Kraft Mattapan Teen 
Center. 

The program participants, 
including Jailah, a member 
of the Gerald and Darlene 
Jordan Club, shared the im-
pact the teen programs have 
had on their lives. What this 
year’s Annual Dinner truly 
highlighted is that, while the 

THE BOYS & GIRLS CLUB OF BOSTON ANNUAL DINNER WAS A TREMENDOUSLY HAPPY OCCASION

Boys & Girls Clubs of Bos-
ton have been delivering fun 
and games for many years, 
they have added another el-
ement of teen services: tu-
toring, after school help, job 
readiness programs and in-
ternships to its older mem-
bers, providing a full spec-
trum for youth development 
in the Boston area. 

Quincy Miller, President and Chief Operating Officer of Eastern Bank, Eneida Román, President 
& CEO of Amplify Latinx, Rose Staram, founder and CEO of RoseMark Production, and Herby 
Duverné, Principal and CEO of Taino Consulting Group pose for a photo at Annual Dinner.

Ashley Freeman, Music Program Manager 
at the [Club Name], performs on stage at 
Annual Dinner.

Music Program Managers and Club Members from across Boys & Girls Club of Boston pose for a group photo after their perfor-
mance.

A member of the Gerald and Darlene Jordan Club 
performing “Happy” by Pharell Williams.

Boys & Girls Clubs of Boston CEO and President, Robert Lewis Jr., greeting guests.

Chair of the Board of Direc-
tors, Melissa Weiner Janfaza, 
gives her opening remarks.

For Advertising Rates, Please Call 
781-485-0588

PHOTOS COURTESY OF THE BOYS & GIRLS CLUB OF BOSTON

See BRUINS BEAT Page 9
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Special to the Record

Russian composer Sergei 
Rachmaninoff’s demanding 
Symphony No. 3 and Mau-
rice Ravel’s delightful 
“Mother Goose Suite” 
highlight the program 
when Music  Director Rob-
ert Lehmann conducts the 
North Shore Philharmonic 
Orchestra in its Winter Con-
cert Sunday, February 23 at 
Swampscott High School 
auditorium. 

 Concert time is 3:00 p.m. 
Tickets will be available at 
the door or can be purchased 
in advance at www.nspo.org 
for $30, $25 for seniors and 
students.   Children 12 and 
under are admitted free.

Also on the concert pro-
gram is the First Essay for 
Orchestra by American 
composer Samuel Barber.

Rachmaninoff, renowned 
for his works for piano, 
wrote three symphonies, 
with some 40 years separat-
ing the first and third.  Crit-
ics claimed that the Third 
was too much a “modern” 
piece and it was not well-re-
ceived by audiences.   Over 
the years, however, Rach-
maninoff’s Third Sympho-
ny has earned its place in 
the symphonic  Repertoire 
for its orchestral color.

Ravel, well-known his 
affection for children and 
animals, originally wrote a 
piano suite for four hands 
based on the famous Moth-
er Goose stories in 1908 and 
four years later wrote the 
Orchestration. The imagina-
tive, medodic music evokes 
the wonderment of the char-
acters “Pavane for Sleeping 
Beauty”, Tom Thumb, the 
Laideronette—Empress of 
the Pagodas, “Beauty and 
the Beast”, and, finally, a 
celebration of nature in The 
Enchanted Garden.

Barber wrote the Essay 
for Orchestra in 1937—(it 
was later retitled “First Es-
say for Orchestra)—appar-
ently at the invitation to the 
celebrated Italian conduc-
tor Arturo Toscannini, who 
conducted the first perfor-
mance with the NBC Sym-
phony Orchestra in a pro-
gram that included Barber’s 
now-famous “Adagio for 
Strings.” The Essay form of 
musical composition devel-
ops a complex and thought-
ful work from a single the-
sis.

The North Shore Phil-
harmonic Orchestra is play-
ing its 76th season. Staffed 
largely by volunteer play-
ers, the NSPO is committed 
to providing affordable ac-

cess to quality classical mu-
sic. The Orchestra strives to 
develop, train, and provide 
opportunities for young 
musicians, while providing 
a large range of programs 

covering the full range of 
symphonic and pops rep-
ertoire for a diverse public.   
For full   concert   informa-
tion, visit www.nspo.org or 
contact info@nspo.org.

North Shore Philharmonic Winter Concert Features music of Ravel, Barber, Rachmaninoff

The North Shore Philharmonic Orchestra performs its “Winter” Concert Sunday, February 23 at 
Swampscott High School.

Music Director Robert Lehmann conducts the North Shore 
Philharmonic Orchestra “Winter” concert Sunday, February 23 
at Swampscott High School.

Fire safety tips to keep your Valentine’s Day safe 
Special to the Record

This Valentine’s Day, 
make sure your romantic 
gestures stay memorable 
for the right reasons. When 
lighting candles and cooking 
a special meal, the National 
Fire Protection Association® 
(NFPA®) says to  closely 
monitor food cooking on the 
stove or in the oven, and to 
use candles with caution.  

“If you’re celebrating 
Valentine’s Day at home 
this year, your plans likely 
include a special meal and 
candles,” said Lorraine Car-

li, vice president of Outreach 
and Advocacy at NFPA. 
“Our goal is to help ensure 
that everyone enjoys the 
holiday with fire safety in 
mind.”

According to NFPA, 
cooking is the leading cause 
of reported home fires and 
home fire injuries year-
round. Unattended cooking 
is a factor in over one-quar-
ter (29 percent) of reported 
home cooking fires and half 
of the associated deaths.  

Simple cooking safety tips 
include the following: 

• Stay in the kitchen when 

frying, grilling, or broiling 
food.

• Have a “kid and pet-free 
zone” of at least 3 feet (1 me-
ter) around the stove.

• Keep a lid nearby when 
cooking. If a small grease 
fire starts, slide the lid over 
the pan and turn off the burn-
er.

• Set a timer to remind you 
that you are cooking. 

Candles are also a lead-
ing cause of home fires and 
must be used with caution 
and supervision. NFPA data 
shows that half of all candle 
fires started when a flamma-

ble object – such as furni-
ture, bedding, curtains, home 
décor, or clothing – was too 
close to a lit candle. In 21 
percent of home candle fires, 
the candle was either left un-
attended, discarded, or oth-
erwise misused. More than 
one-third of candle fires (36 
percent) started in the bed-
room.

Consider using batter-op-
erated flameless candles, 
which proved a similar look 
and feel to real candles while 
eliminating the risk of fire.  

If you do plan to use real 
candles, NFPA recommends 

the following: 
• Don’t use lit candles in 

bedrooms, bathrooms, and 
sleeping areas. 

• Use stable candle hold-
ers and place candles where 
they can’t be easily knocked 
over.

• Keep candles at least one 
foot away from anything that 
can burn. 

• Keep hair and loose 
clothing away from the 
flame.  

• Don’t burn a candle all 
the way down --- put it out 
before it gets too close to the 
holder or container. 

• Store matches and light-
ers up high, out of children’s 
reach, preferably in a locked 
cabinet. 

• Never leave a burning 
candle unattended. 

• Blow out candles when 
you leave the room or go to 
bed.

For more information 
about cooking and candle 
safety, visit our cooking safe-
ty and candle safety pages. 

In addition, NFPA encour-
ages the public to make sure 
they have working smoke 
alarms and develop and 
practice a home escape plan. 

Valentine’s Days tips for finding love, romance or just a dinner date
Special to the Record

Whether you’re in a com-
mitted relationship, swiping 
to find that special someone 
or taking a break from dat-
ing, as Valentine’s Day ap-
proaches it’s obvious that 
love is in the air. Experts 
from the University of New 
Hampshire share some ad-
vice to pinpoint your part-
ner’s passion, design dating 
that fits you—no matter 
your age—and how to nav-
igate today’s technology to 
better make that love con-

nection.
Skip the Grand Gestures

“Valentine’s Day can 
feel like a big test of how 
romantic we are and how 
much we love our partners,” 
said Tyler Jamison, associ-
ate professor of human de-
velopment and family stud-
ies. “Trying to figure out the 
right balance of things to do 
and say can rob any joy Val-
entine’s Day may bring.”

Jamison, a family and 
relationship expert focus-
ing on how people learn the 
skills they need to build and 

maintain strong relation-
ships, said one of the keys 
to a happy partnership is 
asking your partner for what 
you need and want. Take the 
guessing out of the mix and 
use Valentine’s Day as mo-
tivation to practice commu-
nicating more openly. For 
example, take the pressure 
off by letting them know 
what would make the day 
special—a dozen tulips, eat-
ing pizza in sweatpants or 
even skipping the holiday 
altogether. Valentine’s Day 
can be a minefield of expec-

tations but if you focus on 
what is important to you as 
a couple, it can be an oppor-
tunity to develop healthier, 
more authentic relationships 
and share a little love that 
might get lost in everyday 
life.

It’s also an opportunity 
to show that you have the 
pulse of your partner’s fa-
vorite things. Rather than 
gifting chocolate and flow-
ers, think of something that 
your partner loves, like 
watching a favorite movie 
(even if you don’t like it) or 
gifting them the next book 
in a series they can’t put 
down. The best gifts are not 
necessarily the most elabo-
rate or expensive, but ones 
that show you understand 
and appreciate your partner.

“Six or seven years ago, 
I told my husband that the 
best gift he could ever give 
me was writing down how 
he felt about me,” said Jami-
son. “Now, for Valentine’s 
Day and sometimes our 
anniversary, he will gift me 
with a typed list of things he 
likes about me or reasons he 
will never get tired of me. 
They are funny and sweet 
and I never would have got-
ten them without asking.”

Looking for Love…
Later in Life

Dating, especially for 
older adults, can be daunt-
ing and exhausting. But if 
you’re single and ready to 
mingle, Lauren Harris, as-
sistant professor of human 
development and family 
studies has some advice.

“It’s important to remem-
ber that you are never too 
old to find love,” said Har-
ris. “Dating can be a great 
way to meet new people 

and find someone you just 
like spending time with—
whether you are seeking a 
friend for an occasional din-
ner or a spouse to share the 
next chapter of life—and 
you can design the dating 
and relationship experience 
that fits you best.”

Ready for romance? 
Time to get out there.

Harris, who researches 
how gender and age shape 
older adults’ dating expe-
riences, said meeting new 
people will increase your 
chances of finding someone 
special. Here are her tips:

 • Determine what you’re 
looking for. What is im-
portant to you—attraction, 
sense of humor, lifestyle, 
spending time with family.

• Are you looking for 
companionship or mar-
riage? Many older adults, 
particularly women, are 
just seeking a companion—
someone they can spend 
time with, travel, see a 
movie and share a dinner—
while others are hoping to 
find a life partner.

• Join a new group, vol-
unteer or take a class—it 
can help find people with 
like interests.

• Tell your friends and 
family you are ready to start 
dating.

• Consider online dat-
ing—people over 50 are the 
fastest growing group of on-
line daters.

 Tik Tok NO!
  Swiping your phone to 

find a date may be exciting 
and effective, but technolo-
gy can impact relationships 
for the better and the worse. 
Marissa Mosley, assistant 
professor of human devel-
opment and family studies, 

said when building a healthy 
relationship it’s important to 
realize that there is a time 
and place for technology.

“Looking for love on-
line, and communicating 
via email and text once you 
connect, can open up dating 
possibilities and help get to 
know someone, but once 
you’re on that date, it’s time 
to put the phone down,” 
said Mosley who is also a 
marriage and family ther-
apist. “A sweet text or em-
joi can be fun flirting when 
courting but if you’re out to 
dinner, or living together, 
it’s important to communi-
cate—in person—to each 
other to build a healthy re-
lationship.”

  Mosley’s research ex-
plores the role of phub-
bing—paying more atten-
tion to a cell phone than a 
partner—and how that can 
affect both partners. While it 
can help increase emotional 
connections it can also drive 
a wedge between partners if 
one is feeling neglected.

Mosley’s advice to make 
the most of this Valentine’s 
Day:

• Go phub-free—turn off 
cell phones as you enjoy a 
romantic dinner for just two.

• Arrange a movie night 
to watch a favorite flick—
make popcorn, cuddle on 
the couch and share the ex-
perience—no phones or tab-
lets allowed.

• If your partner spends 
too much time online or on 
their phone because they 
experience the fear of miss-
ing out (FOMO), it’s im-
portant communicate how 
that makes you feel.

Clinton Street park named 
for Jaime M. Hernandez

By Adam Swift

One of the city’s newest 
parks, a 27,000-square-
foot space in the Mill Hill 
Neighborhood at 88 Clin-
ton Street, will be named 
for the late Chelsea resident 
Jaime M. Hernandez.

The city council ap-
proved naming the park 
after Hernandez, who died 
last October, at its meeting 
on Monday night.

“In the fall of 2024, 
the City and GreenRoots 
launched a robust commu-
nity naming process, en-
gaging over 500 residents 
in selecting a name for the 
park,” stated City Manager 
Fidel Maltez. “The commu-
nity overwhelming chose to 
honor Mr. Jaime M. Her-
nandez, a beloved Chelsea 
resident and community 
leader whose 30-year jour-

ney in Chelsea made a last-
ing impact on our city, and 
who sadly passed away on 
October 21, 2024.”

Hernandez was born in 
San Vicente, El Salvador 
and was a devoted fami-
ly man whose love for his 
wife, Reina, and their chil-
dren, Danielamarina and 
Jaime Jose, was the founda-
tion of his life, Maltez said.

“His deep ties to Chelsea 
and his tireless support for 
his hometown in El Salva-
dor reflected his commit-
ment to serving others,” 
Maltez stated. “Jaime’s 
passion for sports, volun-
teer work, and fostering 
community connections in-
spired all who knew him. 
He was a vibrant leader 
whose generosity continues 
to resonate within our com-
munity.”

Naming the park af-
ter Hernandez reflects not 
only his legacy, but also the 
city’s commitment to inte-
grating the diverse cultures 
and stories of its residents 
in the fabric of Chelsea’s 
future, Maltez added.

The project at 88 Clinton 
Street was completed at the 
end of December.

“This new open space 
will serve as a refuge from 
extreme heat, a place for 
community gathering, and 
a celebration of the natural 
beauty of Mill Creek,” said 
Maltez. 

The park is designed to 
promote climate resilience 
through green infrastruc-
ture, provide spaces for 
intergenerational use, and 
offer opportunities for re-
flection, education, and 
community connection.
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CHELSEA TURNS OUT TO SUPPORT JOSH KRAFT AT MAYORAL CAMPAIGN RECEPTION

Chelsea residents and 
community leaders joined a 
capacity crowd of support-
ers at a campaign reception 
for Josh Kraft, who has an-
nounced that he is running 
for Mayor of Boston.

Kraft is a well known 
figure in the city of Chelsea 
for his incredible work as 
the founder and executive 

director of the Jordan Boys 
and Girls Club. Kraft led 
a fundraising drive for the 
construction of the state-
of-the-art $11 million club-
house on Willow Street. 

Mark White, son of for-
mer Boston Mayor, the late 
Kevin H. White, introduced 
Kraft to the large and enthu-
siastic crowd.

Mark White, Josh Kraft, and Mark Robinson.

Josh Kraft and Cataldo Ambulance President Dennis Cataldo.

Former state senator Frank Mastrocola, Michelle Perez, and 
Judy Mastrocola.

Mayoral candidate Josh Kraft, with Arlene Robinson, and 
Councillor-at-Large Leo Robinson.

Shelagh Mahoney McNamee, Josh Kraft, and Jennifer Meehan. Well-known Chelsea resident and community leader Carolyn 
Boumila-Vega and Josh Kraft.

The Robinson family turned out to support mayoral candidate Josh Kraft at the campaign 
kickoff reception.

The McNamee family welcomes Josh Kraft to the Eastern Minerals community room where the 
fundraiser was held. From left, are Joseph McNamee, Josh Kraft, Shelagh Mahoney McNamee, 
Sean McNamee, and Michael McNamee.

Hilton Garden Inn Sales Manager Steve Haley, Boston mayoral candidate Josh Kraft, Hilton 
Garden Inn Catering Manager Gina Guange, and Chelsea Chamber of Commerce Past President 
Joseph Vinard.

BU Law School students Jack Leary, Lila Norris, and Ellery Robinson greet mayoral candidate 
Josh Kraft at the campaign reception.

found the back of the net. It 
was ‘game over’ from there, 
as Boston University held 
their ground and the lead, 
to earn themselves well-de-
served bragging rights. Bos-
ton University head coach 
Jay Pandolfo heaped praise 
on his team, stating. “They 
are a competitive bunch of 
guys, I’m just so proud of 
them, and I’m really happy 
for them.”

In the consolation game, 
Harvard outlasted North-
eastern by a score of 4-3, 
in a physical game, full of 
penalties. The Huskies were 
hit with a five-minute major 
penalty to Joaquim Lemay, 
for crosschecking, Harvard 
was unable to capitalize on 
it, and it resulted in a tightly 
contested game right up un-
til the final minute. Harvard 
was able to pot four power 
play goals, two off the stick 

of Mason Langenbrunner, a 
Bruins fifth round draft pick 
from the 2020 NHL Draft, 
and it proved to be the dif-
ference in the consolation 
game’s outcome.

Charlie Jacobs Joins The 
USA Hockey Foundation 
Board of Directors

            The USA Hock-
ey Foundation announced 
that Charlie Jacobs, chief 
executive officer of both 
the Boston Bruins and Del-
aware North, will join its 
Board of Directors. An in-
fluential leader in the sports 
and entertainment industry, 
Jacobs, who also serves as 
alternate governor for the 
Bruins, brings extensive 
experience in sports man-
agement and philanthropy 
that will be invaluable in 
furthering The USA Hock-
ey Foundation’s mission of 
supporting grassroots hock-

ey development, player 
safety initiatives, and access 
to the game for all. Jacobs 
founded the Boston Bru-
ins Foundation in 2003 and 
since its inception more than 
67 million dollars has been 
raised to help in supporting 
a strong support system for 
children and families in the 
community though educa-
tion, athletics, and health 
and wellness. Jacobs joins a 
distinguished group of lead-
ers committed to advancing 
the Foundation’s efforts in 
strengthening hockey across 
the country. His involve-
ment will support ongoing 
initiatives to enhance op-
portunities for players of all 
ages and skill levels, while 
also promoting the values 
of teamwork, perseverance, 
and sportsmanship.

Bruins Beat //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 7
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LEGAL NOTICES
LEGAL NOTICE

NOTICE OF 
HEARING
Case No. 
2024-26

In accordance with the 
Massachusetts Zoning Act, 
Chapter 40A and Section 
34-108(b) of the Chelsea 
Zoning Ordinance, a public 
hearing of the Chelsea 
Planning Board will be 
held at 
Council Chambers, City 
Hall, 500 Broadway
Tuesday, February 25, 
2025, 6:00 PM
For Special Permit seeking 
approval to construct a 
planted screen of less 
than ten feet between the 
BR and R2 Districts at the 
premises known as:
105-115 Park Street, 12 
Essex Street, 1 Ellsworth 
Street
All interested parties are 
encouraged to attend.
A copy of the application 
and petition is available 
for review at: 
City Clerk’s Office during 
normal business hours:  
Monday, Wednesday and 
Thursday 8 a.m. to 4 p.m. 
– Tuesday,
8 a.m. – 7 p.m. – Friday, 8 
a.m. to noon

2/6/25, 2/13/25
C

LEGAL NOTICE

CITY OF CHELSEA
REQUEST FOR 
PROPOSALS

Chelsea Emergency 
Shelter and 
Homelessness 
Prevention
The City of Chelsea, 
Massachusetts, through its 
Chief Procurement Officer, 
is seeking Request for 
Proposals for “Chelsea 
Emergency Shelter and 
Homelessness Prevention”.  
Request for Proposals will 
be available on or after 
February 13, 2025 by vis-
iting the City’s website at 
https://www.chelseama.
gov/departments/purchas-
ing/current_bids___so-
licitations.php.    
Proposals must be sealed 
and clearly marked 
“Chelsea Emergency 
Shelter and Homelessness 
Prevention”and submitted 
to the Office of the Chief 
Procurement Officer no 
later than 11:00AM on 
Thursday, February 27, 
2025.
The City of Chelsea 
reserves the right to accept 
any proposal, to reject any 
or all proposals and to 
waive minor irregularities 
and/or formalities as it 
deems to be in the best 
interest of the City.
In accordance with our 
Minority Business Enter-
prise Plan, we are inviting 
all qualified women and 
minority business firms to 
respond.
The City of Chelsea is 
an Equal Opportunity 
Employer.
This Request for Proposals 
is in accordance with 

M.G.L. Chapter 30B.
Dragica Ivanis
Chief Procurement Officer

2/13/25
C

    LEGAL NOTICE                          
CITATION GIVING 

NOTICE OF 
PETITION FOR 
REMOVAL OF A 

GUARDIAN OF AN 
INCAPACITATED 

PERSON 
Docket No. 

SU24P1069GD 
Commonwealth of 
Massachusetts 
The Trial Court 
Suffolk Probate 
and Family Court 
24 New Chardon Street 
Boston MA, 02114
In the interests of: 
Geraldine Martin of: 
Chelsea, MA 
RESPONDENT Incapacitated 
Person/Protected Person 
To the named Respondent 
and all other interested 
persons, a petition has 
been filed by 
Mass. Dept of Mental 
Health of Westborough, 
MA in the above captioned 
matter requesting that the 
court: Remove the Guard-
ian of the respondent.
The petition asks the court 
to make a determination 
that the Guardian and/
or Conservator should 
be allowed to resign; or 
should be removed for 
good cause; or that the 
Guardianship and/or Con-
servatorship is no longer 
necessary and therefore 
should be terminated. The 
original petition is on file 
with the court. 
You have the right to ob-
ject to this proceeding.  If 
you wish to do so, you or 
your attorney must file a 
written appearance at this 
court on or before 10:00 
AM on the return date of 
02/27/2025. This day is 
NOT a hearing date, but 
a deadline date by which 
you have to file the written 
appearance if you object to 
the petition.  If you fail to 
file the written appearance 
by the return date, action 
may be taken in this mat-
ter without further notice 
to you. In addition to filing 
the written appearance, 
you or your attorney must 
file a written affidavit stat-
ing the specific facts and 
grounds of your objection 
within 30 days after the 
return date.
IMPORTANT NOTICE 
The outcome of this 
proceeding may limit or 
completely take away the 
above-named person’s 
right to make decisions 
about personal affairs or 
financial affairs or both.  
The above-named person 
has the right to ask for a 
lawyer.  Anyone may make 
this request on behalf of 
the above-named person.  
If the above-named person 
cannot afford a lawyer, 
one may be appointed at 
State expense. 
WITNESS, Hon. Brian J. 
Dunn, First Justice of this 
Court. 
Date: January 30, 2025
Stephanie Everett, Register 
of Probate

2/13/25
C

LEGAL NOTICE

CITY OF CHELSEA
REQUEST FOR 

QUALIFICATIONS
HOUSE DOCTOR 
ENGINEERING & 

DESIGN SERVICES 
FOR CHELSEA PUBLIC 

BUILDINGS AND GROUNDS
The City of Chelsea, 
Massachusetts, through its 
Chief Procurement Officer, 
is seeking Request for 
Qualifications for “House 
Doctor Engineering & 
Design Services for Chelsea 
Public Buildings and 
Grounds”.  
Request for Qualifications 
will be available on or 
after February 13, 2025 
by visiting the City’s 
website at https://
www.chelseama.gov/
departments/purchasing/
current_bids___solicita-
tions.php.  
Proposals must be sealed 
and clearly marked “House 
Doctor Engineering & 
Design Services for Chelsea 
Public Buildings and 
Grounds” and submitted 
to the Office of the Chief 
Procurement Officer no 
later than 11:00AM on 
Thursday, March 06, 2025.
The City of Chelsea 
reserves the right to accept 
any proposal, to reject any 
or all proposals and to 
waive minor irregularities 
and/or formalities as it 
deems to be in the best 
interest of the City.
In accordance with our 
Minority Business Enter-
prise Plan, we are inviting 
all qualified women and 
minority business firms to 
respond.
The City of Chelsea is 
an Equal Opportunity 
Employer.
Dragica Ivanis
Chief Procurement Officer

2/13/25
C

LEGAL NOTICE

CITY OF CHELSEA
INVITATION FOR 

BIDS
LANDSCAPING 

SERVICES 
FOR CHELSEA 

PUBLIC SCHOOLS
The City of Chelsea, 
Massachusetts, through its 
Chief Procurement Officer, 
is seeking Bids for marked 
“Landscaping Services for 
Chelsea Public Schools”.
Invitation for Bids will 
be available on or after 
February 13, 2025 by vis-
iting the City’s website at 
https://www.chelseama.
gov/departments/purchas-
ing/current_bids___so-
licitations.php.    
Bids must be sealed 
and clearly marked 
“Landscaping Services for 
Chelsea Public Schools” 
and submitted to the Office 
of the Chief Procurement 
Officer no later than 
10:00AM on Thursday, 
March 06, 2025.
The City of Chelsea 

reserves the right to accept 
any proposal, to reject any 
or all proposals and to 
waive minor irregularities 
and/or formalities as it 
deems to be in the best 
interest of the City.
In accordance with our 
Minority Business Enter-
prise Plan, we are inviting 
all qualified women and 
minority business firms to 
respond.
The City of Chelsea is 
an Equal Opportunity 
Employer.
This Invitation for Bids is 
in accordance with M.G.L. 
Chapter 30B.
Dragica Ivanis
Chief Procurement Officer

2/13/25
C

                              
LEGAL NOTICE
Public Announcement 

of Invitation to 
submit a 

REQUEST FOR 
PROPOSAL 

The enclosed REQUEST FOR 
PROPOSAL (RFP) and ac-
companying Specifications 
are for your convenience 
in submitting a proposal 
for the enclosed referenced 
products and services: 
Locker Room Renovation
65 Nahant Ave
Revere, MA 02151
CAPIC
CLOSING DAY AND TIME: 
Sealed proposals will be 
received no later than:  
March 7, 2025 at 10:00AM
Small and minority firms 
are encouraged to apply. 
The advertisement is 
subject in all respects to 
the terms and conditions of 
the request for proposals. 
CAPIC, Inc. is an Equal 
Opportunity Employer/
Affirmative Action Agency.
PLEASE MARK SEALED 
ENVELOPE: 
“Locker Room Renovation”
RETURN PROPOSAL TO:
Community Action Pro-
grams Inter-City, Inc.
Attn: Richelle Cromwell, 
Executive Director
100 Everett Avenue, Unit 
14
Chelsea, MA 02150
Organizational Overview 
Community Action 
Programs Inter-City, Inc. 
(CAPIC) invites qualified 
vendors to submit propos-
als to perform renovations 
for the locker room at the 
CAPIC Head Start Program 
in Revere, MA. CAPIC 
is a private, non-profit 
corporation chartered in 
1967 and designated to 
identify and eradicate the 
root causes of poverty 
in Chelsea, Revere and 
Winthrop.  CAPIC has been 
designated by the State 
and Federal Government 
as a Community Action 
Agency and currently em-
ploys approximately 115 
employees. CAPIC’s After 
School Program provides 
Project Description 
Demolish existing locker 
room space and renovate 
it into two classroom 
spaces with a connecting 
bathroom. 
The current structure 
measures 904 square feet. 
The perimeter is 273 feet. 
There is 1,423 square feet 
of ceramic wall. 
Currently there are 6 
shower heads, 2 toilets, 1 

urinal, and 4 sinks. They 
will need to be demolished 
to clear space for the 
classrooms. A new sink 
and toilet will need to 
be installed in the new 
bathroom. 
New dry wall, flooring, 
lights, and an outside 
window will need to be 
installed. 
This project includes 
plumbing and electrical 
work. 
Required Documents
On 8.5” by 11” white pa-
per in portrait orientation, 
include:
1. Your company name 
and address
2. Net terms
3. The list of above 
equipment, with unit, and 
extended pricing.
4. SOW for installation, 
including scheduling, 
and fees or penalties for 
termination
TAXES
CAPIC is exempt from 
Federal Excise and State 
Sales tax; therefore, tax 
must not be included in the 
proposal price. 
RESERVATION OF RIGHTS
* CAPIC reserves the right 
to accept any proposal 
or alternative proposal 
proposed in whole or in 
part, to reject any or all 
proposals or alternatives 
proposals in whole or in 
part and to waive irregu-
larity and/or informalities 
in any proposal and to 
make the award in any 
manner deemed in the 
best interest of CAPIC.
* CAPIC reserves the right 
not to consider any pro-
posal which it determines 
to be unresponsive and 
deficient in any of the 
information requested 
within the RFP.
* CAPIC reserves the right 
to determine whether the 
scope of the project will 
be implemented entirely 
as described in the RFP, 
a portion of the scope, or 
that a revised scope be 
implemented.
CAPIC appreciates your 
time and effort in prepar-
ing this proposal. Please 
note that all proposals 
must be received at the 
designated location by the 
above referenced deadline. 
Proposals received after 
the deadline will not be 
considered for the award 
of the contract, and will 
be considered void and 
unacceptable.

2/12/25, 2/13/25
R,C.W

LEGAL NOTICE
COMMONWEALTH

OF MASSACHUSETTS
THE TRIAL COURT

PROBATE AND
FAMILY COURT

Suffolk Probate
And Family Court
24 New Chardon St.
Boston, MA 02114
(617)788-8300
CITATION ON
PETITION FOR
CHANGE OF NAME
Docket No.
SU25C0075CA
In the matter of:
Lourden Magdalena
Arbaiza Castellon
A Petition to Change Name 
of Adult has been filed 
by Lourden Magdalena 

Arbaiza Castellon of Chel-
sea, MA requesting that 
the court enter a Decree 
changing their name to:
Lourden Magdalena 
Castellon Arbaiza
IMPORTANT NOTICE
Any person may 
appear for purposes of 
objecting to the petition 
by filing an appearance 
at:Suffolk Probate and 
Family Court before 10:00 
a.m.on the return date 
of 02/20/2025. This 
is NOT a hearing date, 
but a deadline by which 
you must file a written 
appearance if you object to 
this proceeding.
WITNESS, Hon. Brian J. 
Dunn, First Justice of this 
Court.
Date: January 28, 2025
Stephanie L. Everett,
Register of Probate

2/13/25
C

LEGAL NOTICE

N O T I C E
In accordance with Section 
6-3 (b) of the Chelsea City 
Charter notice is hereby 
given that at a Regular 
Meeting of the Chelsea 
Traffic and Parking Com-
mission held on January 
7, 2025, the Commission 
voted to approve the 
following regulations:
To install a three-way 
‘Stop’ sign on Spencer 
Avenue.  
To designate two (2) 
on-street parking spaces at 
170 Cottage Street for the 
duration of six months.
To install two (2) loading 
zones on Central Avenue 
and to add short-term 
parking meters on Willow 
Street.
To post a handicap sign at 
63 Shawmut Street.
To post a handicap sign at 
98 Marlboro Street.
To post a handicap sign at 
151 Shurtleff Street.
To install a ‘Stop’ sign on 
Central Avenue, at Lynn 
Street, for three months as 
a trial basis 
To convert Shawmut Street, 
from Central to Chester Av-
enue, to a one-way street 
during the construction 
and renovations of the 
Garden Cemetery.
Jeannette Cintron White
Parking Clerk

2/13/25
C

LEGAL NOTICE

CITY OF CHELSEA 
DEPARTMENT OF 
PUBLIC WORKS
INVITATION FOR 

BIDS
On-Call Ordinary 
and Emergency 
Tree Work
The City of Chelsea, 
Massachusetts, through its 
Chief Procurement Officer, 
is seeking sealed bids for 
all labor, equipment and 
materials for “On-Call 
Ordinary and Emergency 
Tree Work”.  
Invitation for Bids will 

be available on or after 
February 13, 2025 by vis-
iting the City’s website at 
https://www.chelseama.
gov/departments/purchas-
ing/current_bids___so-
licitations.php.  
Bids must be sealed and 
clearly marked “On-Call 
Ordinary and Emergency 
Tree Work” and submitted 
to the Office of the Chief 
Procurement Officer no 
later than 11:00 AM on 
Thursday, February 27, 
2025.
Each bid must be accompa-
nied by a certified check, 
issued by a responsible 
bank or trust company.  Or 
a bid bond duly executed 
by the bidder as principal 
and having as surety 
thereon a surety company 
approved by the City, all in 
the amount of 5% of the 
bid payable to the “City of 
Chelsea.”
The City of Chelsea 
reserves the right to accept 
any proposal, to reject any 
or all proposals and to 
waive minor irregularities 
and/or formalities as it 
deems to be in the best 
interest of the City.
In accordance with our 
Minority Business Enter-
prise Plan, we are inviting 
all qualified women and 
minority business firms to 
respond.
The City of Chelsea is 
an Equal Opportunity 
Employer.
This Invitation for Bids is 
in accordance with M.G.L. 
Chapter 30, 39M.
Dragica Ivanis
Chief Procurement Officer

2/13/25
C

LEGAL NOTICE

Legal Notice
City of Chelsea
Public Hearing

The City of Chelsea 
Department of Hous-
ing and Community 
Development will hold an 
in-person Public Hearing 
on Wednesday, March 5, 
2025 at 6:00 p.m. in the 
Auditorium at Chelsea 
Public Library, located at 
569 Broadway, Chelsea, 
MA 02150. The purpose 
of this meeting is to 
discuss the City’s proposed 
Community Development 
Block Grant (CDBG) 
Application for Fiscal 
Year 2025, our successful 
application from FY24, and 
proposed additional work 
in the FY22/23 grant year. 
We will review the year’s 
proposed Community 
Development Strategy, and 
generate public input. This 
Public Hearing is a require-
ment prior to submitting 
a CDBG application to the 
Massachusetts Department 
of Housing and Livable 
Communities.
CDBG funds may be used 
for eligible projects/
activities in the categories, 
including but not limited 
to, housing rehabilitation, 
community economic 
development, public 
facilities/infrastructure, 
planning, and/or public/
social services. The FY2024 

grant was awarded for 
public social services and 
infrastructure improve-
ments for Bloomingdale 
Street. Public social 
services funding supports 
Community Schools ESOL 
classes, a citizenship and 
immigration services pro-
gram, the REACH program 
for at-risk middle and high 
school students and senior 
food delivery. 
Comments will also be 
solicited on the use of 
remaining FY22/23 CDBG 
money for infrastructure 
improvements on Cottage 
Street, and on the upcom-
ing FY25 application. The 
FY25 program is planned 
to include the renovation 
of the Tot Lot at Voke Park 
and improvements to 
Chelsea Housing Authority 
buildings. Public social 
services funding supports 
Community Schools ESOL 
classes, a citizenship and 
immigration services 
program, and the REACH 
program for at-risk middle 
and high school students.
The City of Chelsea is a 
Mini-entitlement commu-
nity that receives CDBG 
funds on a non-competitive 
basis for eligible activities. 
The City of Chelsea’s 
Department of Housing 
and Development staff 
will implement the CDBG 
program. Staff from the 
Chelsea Department of 
Housing and Community 
Development will be 
present to hear any and 
all recommendations. All 
persons or organizations 
wishing to comment will 
be given an opportunity 
to be heard. You may 
also submit comments in 
writing by March 28, 2025 
to the Chelsea Department 
of Housing and Community 
Development, 500 Broad-
way, Room 101, Chelsea, 
MA 02150, Attn: CDBG 
Program, or via email to 
bcares@chelseama.gov
Benjamin Cares
Director, Housing and 
Community Development
City of Chelsea

2/13/2025, 2/27/25
C

LEGAL NOTICE

Aviso Legal
Ciudad de Chelsea
Audiencia Pública

El Departamento de 
Vivienda y Desarrollo 
Comunitario de la Ciudad 
de Chelsea llevará a cabo 
una Audiencia Pública en 
persona el miércoles 5 
de marzo de 2025, a las 
6 p.m. en el Auditorio de 
la Biblioteca Pública de 
Chelsea, ubicado en 569 
Broadway, Chelsea, MA 
02150. El propósito de 
esta reunión es discutir 
la solicitud de la Ciudad 
propuesta para el Año 
Fiscal 2025 al programa 
de subvenciones en bloque 
para el desarrollo comu-
nitario (CDBG), nuestra 
solicitud exitosa del año 
fiscal 2024 y propuesta 
de trabajo adicional en el 
año de subvención del año 
fiscal 2022/23. Nosotras 
revisaremos la Estrategia 

de Desarrollo Comuni-
tario propuesta para el 
año y generar aportes 
públicos. Esta Audiencia 
Pública es requerida por el 
Departamento de Vivienda 
y Desarrollo Comunitario 
de Massachusetts antes de 
someter una solicitud a los 
fondos de CDBG. 
Los fondos CDBG pueden 
usarse para proyectos/
actividades elegibles en las 
categorías - incluidas pero 
no limitadas - rehabil-
itación de viviendas, 
desarrollo económico 
comunitario, instalaciones 
/ infraestructura públicas, 
planificación y/o servicios 
públicos/sociales. La 
subvención del año fiscal 
2024 se otorgó para ser-
vicios sociales públicos y 
mejoras de infraestructura 
para Bloomingdale Street. 
Los fondos de servicios 
sociales públicos apoyan 
las clases de ESOL de las 
escuelas comunitarias, un 
programa de servicios de 
ciudadanía e inmigración, 
el programa REACH para 
estudiantes de secundaria 
y preparatoria en riesgo 
y la entrega de alimentos 
para personas mayores.
También se solicitarán 
comentarios sobre el 
uso del dinero restante 
del CDBG del año fiscal 
22/23 para mejoras de 
infraestructura en Cottage 
Street y sobre la próxima 
solicitud para el año fiscal 
2025. Está previsto que el 
programa del año fiscal 
2025 incluya la renovación 
del Tot Lot en Voke Park y 
mejoras en los edificios de 
la Autoridad de Vivienda 
de Chelsea. Los fondos de 
servicios sociales públicos 
apoyan las clases de ESOL 
de las escuelas comuni-
tarias, un programa de 
servicios de ciudadanía e 
inmigración y el programa 
REACH para estudiantes de 
secundaria y preparatoria 
en riesgo.
La ciudad de Chelsea 
es una comunidad con 
mini-beneficios que 
recibe fondos CDBG de 
forma no competitiva para 
actividades elegibles. El 
personal del Departa-
mento de Vivienda y 
Desarrollo Comunitario de 
la Ciudad de Chelsea va a 
implementar el programa 
CDBG. Personal del 
Departamento de Vivienda 
y Desarrollo Comunitario 
va a estar presente para 
recibir cualquier y todas 
las recomendaciones. 
Todas las personas u 
organizaciones que deseen 
comentar tendrán la posib-
ilidad de ser escuchadas. 
También puede enviar 
comentarios por escrito 
antes del 28 de marzo de 
2025 al Departamento 
de Vivienda y Desarrollo 
Comunitario, 500 Broad-
way, Oficina 101, Chelsea, 
MA 02150, Attn: CDBG 
Programa, o por email a 
bcares@chelseama.gov. 
Ben Cares
Director de Vivienda y 
Desarrollo Comunitario
Ciudad de Chelsea 

2/13/2025,2/27/25
C

Healey-Driscoll Administration announces DCR’s free family programming for school vacation week 
As part of the agency’s 

commitment to providing 
safe and fun recreation-
al opportunities for young 
people across the state, the 
Department of Conserva-
tion and Recreation (DCR) 
announced its lineup of 
February school vacation 
week programming. This 
year, the agency is offering 
families 79 free, engaging 
and educational programs 
at 20 state parks and water-
sheds ranging from guided 
hikes to animal tracking, 
craft making, and maple 
sugaring. Programs will run 
from Saturday, February 
15, through Sunday, Febru-
ary 23, with the goal of in-
spiring kids to get outdoors 
and experience the beauty 
of the Massachusetts State 
Parks system.   

“School may be closed 
for the week, but we’re 
continuing the learning in 
outdoor classrooms. Our 
February school break pro-

gramming is a great way 
for us to teach kids about 
the natural world around 
them and help inspire the 
next generation of envi-
ronmental stewards,” said 
DCR Commissioner Brian 
Arrigo. “We hope this slate 
of fun and educational pro-
gramming brings some new 
and curious minds to our 
properties next week. Our 
team of park interpreters 
looks forward to meeting 
and welcoming students 
across the state.” 

To celebrate school vaca-
tion week, DCR is waiving 
parking fees at parks offer-
ing programming. In addi-
tion to offering program-
ming DCR is extending 
public skating hours during 
the week at its agency-man-
aged

 rinks from 10 a.m. until 
2:50 p.m. daily. DCR will 
also continue to offer its 
regular programming, in-
cluding self-guided hikes, 

and visitor centers will be 
open for people to enjoy 
exhibits. For details about 
staff-led programs and self-
guide activities, visit DCR’s 
website.

 Additionally, DCR is 
offering adaptive  program-
ming during February vaca-
tion week.  

DCR encourages partic-
ipants to tweet, post, and 
tag photos on social media 
using @MassDCR. DCR is 
promoting this year’s Feb-
ruary break  programming 
with engaging videos and 
fun graphics on its social 
media channels, including 
X (Twitter), Instagram and 
Threads. For a full list of 
all programming offered 
during school vacation 
week visit DCR’s  website. 

Highlights from next 
week’s February break pro-
gramming include:  

Boston Region 
Dream Street Story-

Walk® at Roxbury Heri-

tage State Park, 183 Rox-
bury St., Boston

Saturday, February 15 
- Tuesday, February 25, 9 
a.m. - 5:30 p.m. 

Visit Dream Street, 
where everyone is special, 
and children believe their 
dreams will come true! This 
magical  story celebrates 
the Roxbury neighborhood 
where the author and her 
cousin, award-winning il-
lustrator Ekua Holmes, 
grew up.

The StoryWalk® Project 
was created by Anne Fergu-
son of Montpelier, VT, and 
developed in collaboration 
with the Kellogg-Hubbard  
Library. Story Walk® is 
a registered service mark 
owned by Ms. Ferguson. 
This StoryWalk® is provid-
ed by Massachusetts De-
partment of Conservation 
and Recreation Interpretive 
Services. 

Ice Skating Party at Ster-
iti Rink, 561 Commercial 

St., Boston 
Friday, February 21, 12 – 

4 p.m. 
Join DCR and Boston 

Harbor Now as part of the 
Highland Street Founda-
tion’s Winter Camp for a 
day of ice skating  at the 
Steriti Memorial Skating 
Rink in Boston’s North 
End neighborhood. Choose 
from sessions lasting 45 
minutes each, starting at 12 
p.m., 1 p.m., 2 p.m. and 3 
p.m. Rental skates will be 
provided for free! Skate and 
dance along with music by 
DJ WhySham, enjoy

 Regina Pizzeria, Munch-
kin Donut Holes, and drinks 
when not on the rink. Don’t 
forget to bring a water bot-
tle! 

Pre-registration is *high-
ly* encouraged for groups 
of 10 or more or if you have 
a time constraint, but there 
will  be capacity for walk-
ups during all skating ses-
sions. Ice

Skating Party at Steriti 
Memorial Rink! at High-
land Street Winter Camp 
Tickets, Fri, Feb 21, 2025 
at 12:00 p.m. | Eventbrite 

The Massachusetts De-
partment of Conservation 
and Recreation (DCR), 
an agency of the Execu-
tive Office of Energy and 
Environmental Affairs, 
oversees 450,000 acres of 
parks and forests, beach-
es, bike trails, watersheds, 
dams, and parkways. Led 
by Commissioner Brian 
Arrigo, the agency’s mis-
sion is to protect, promote, 
and enhance our common 
wealth  of natural, cultural, 
and recreational resources 
for the wellbeing of all. To 
learn more about DCR, our 
facilities, and our programs, 
please visit www.mass.gov/
dcr. Contact us at mass.
parks@state.ma.us.
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400 quartet of Sherwin 
Kim, Joao Cassim, Bry-
an Amaya-Yanes, and 
Xavier Guzman brought 
home first-medals at last 
Monday’s Greater Boston 
League (GBL) Champion-
ship Meet that was held at 
the Reggie Lewis Athletic 
Center in Roxbury.

The foursome fin-
ished with a time of 3:43.89, 
barely edging the sec-
ond-place Revere squad by 
0.78 of a second.

In another relay event, 
the Red Devil 4 x 800 crew 
of Kyle Leong, Carlos Pe-
rez-Acosta, Eric Ander-
son, and Ivan Irias earned 
fourth-place medals with 
their time of 9:38.59.

The top individual fin-
isher  fior  Chelsea was 
Ariel Chacon-Aracena, 
who scored eight points 
and brought home a sec-
ond-place medal in the 
shot-put with a throw of 
46’-6”. Teammate  Adonis 
Alvarez-Umana earned a 
fifth-place medal in the shot 
with a toss of 39’-6”.

Joao Cassim scored two 
points with a fifth place per-
formance in the 300 dash in 
38.70.

Xavier Guzman scored 
two points with a fifth-place 
effort  in the 600m with a 
time  of 1:29.50 and Sher-
win Kim grabbed a sixth-
place  medal in the 600 in 
1:33.35.

Carlos Perez-Acosta 
added a point and earned a 
medal with his sixth-place 
finish in the 1000m with a 
clocking of 2:56.00.

The Chelsea boys tallied 
30 points at the meet to fin-
ish in fifth-place among the 
eight GBL teams who were 
competing.

CHS BOYS NEED
TO RUN THE TABLE
TO REACH TOURNEY

The Chelsea High boys 
basketball  team will need 
to  run the table in its final 
five games of the season 
if they hope to punch their 
ticket for a Journey  to the 
Tourney.

Coach Cesar Castro’s 
Red Devils stand at 5-10 on 
the season and need to win 
out in order to finish with the 
.500 record that is needed to 
qualify for the post-season 
state tournament.

After pulling out an ex-
citing 62-59 victory in 
overtime over Tech Boston 
in which junior Mo Os-
man paced Chelsea with 
20 points and sophomore 
George Chappell made the 
game-winning basket, a 
win that Castro described as 
a “tough, gritty game,”  the 
Red Devils came up short in 
contests this past week with 
Boston English and Lynn 
Tech.

The Devils were sched-
uled to begin their tourney 
quest last night (Wednes-

day) at East Boston and will 
host Medford tomorrow 
(Friday) evening at 6:00. 
They will play in a vaca-

tion week tournament at 
Lincoln Sudbury on Sun-
day and Monday and will 
wrap up their season by 

hosting Lynn Classical next 
Wednesday for a 6:00 open-
ing tip in the CHS gym.

• Revere • Everett • Winthrop • Lynn • East Boston • Chelsea • Charlestown 
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APT FOR RENT

Winthrop Fort Heath  Ocean View: 1 Bedroom starting at 
$2195, modernized. Minutes to Boston. Heat, hot water  , 
amenities , pool, billiard /excerise rooms, sunroom, view 
& steps to ocean. Non smoking, No pets.  Call Debera, 
617-846-7300. 1/29/25

2 col. x 1 inch
$10/wk

1 col. x  
2 inches
$10/wk

Chelsea'Chelsea's s Professional Professional 
Service DirectoryService Directory

2 col. x 2 inch
$240.00 for 
3 Months 

PLEASE RECYCLE
 THIS NEWSPAPER

John J. Recca 
Painting

Interior/Exterior 
Commercial/Residential

Fully Insured 
Quality Work

Reasonable Rates   
Free Estimates

781-241-2454

PAINTING

REAL ESTATE

Nick 
D’Agostino
Professional 

Painter
Cell: 

617-270-3178
Fully Insured
Free Estimates

PLUMBING

CALL

MASTER PLUMBER
LIC #10914 $75/HR

781-853-9108
ELEC. DRAIN CLEANING

EDWARD DILORENZO
NOT FIXED - NOT CHARGED

ELECTRICIAN

M
OONEY ELECTRIC LLC

Residential & 
Commercial

Fully Licensed & Insured

KEVIN MOONEY
781-799-1862

Millennium Real Estate
291 Ferry Street, 
Everett, MA 02149

Gina S Soldano REALTOR®
ABR®, AHWD, e-PRO®, GREEN, MRP®, PSA®, SFR®, SRES®, SRS®

Broker/Associate

Millennium Real Estate 
291 Ferry Street 
Everett, MA 02149

Gina S Soldano REALTOR®
ABR®, AHWD, e-PRO®, GREEN, MRP®, PSA®, SFR®, SRES®, SRS®

Broker/Associate

(857) 272-4270
Gina.Soldano@era.com 

gsoldanorealtor.com
(857) 272-4270

GinaSSoldano@gmail.com 
gsoldanorealtor.com

LANDSCAPING

CHELSEA
Land on Chelsea 
Creek for Lease

Water Dependent 
Industrial Uses Only

Please Contact:
Andy McLaughlin
(312) 935-2800

LAND FOR LEASE

WEST REVERE - 1 BR 
“in-law” apt. w/private 
entrance. Recent Reno.New 
appliances. Close to Bus, 

Heat incl. No Smoking - No 
Pets. $2000/mo 1st/last 
req’d. 617-872-2493
2_12

APT FOR RENT

OBITUARIES
All obituaries and death 

notices will be at a cost of 
$195.00 per paper. 

Includes photo.No word Limit. 
Please send to 

obits@reverejournal.com
or call 781-485-0588

OBITUARIES

“Meeting the needs of the families we serve.” 

ANTHONY MEMORIAL -
FRANK A. WELSH & SONS 

FUNERAL HOME
Peter A. Zaksheski 

Type III Licensed Funeral Director

718 Broadway, Chelsea  –  617-889-2723  –  617-884-3259
www.ChelseaFuneralService.com

TORF FUNERAL
SERVICE

Pre-need planning with our 
price protection guarantee. 

Arrangements made at our  
facility or in the comfort of  

your own home
4 generations of  the Torf  Tradition:

Deborah Torf  Golden    Amy Torf  Golden
Hyman J. Torf  (1903-2000)

M.L. Torf  (1867-1940)
Richard A. Pruneau

(617) 889-2900
(800)428-7161

www.torffuneralservice.com

Carafa Family 
Funeral 

Home Inc.
389 Washington Ave.

Chelsea
617-884-4188

Amy C-Almas
William R. Carafa - 
Funeral Directors

carafafuneralhome.com
visit www.chelsearecord.com

To place a  memoriam in the 
Chelsea Record please call 781-485-0588

Helena Bishop
1961-2024

Helena Elizabeth Bishop, 
63, passed away peaceful-
ly on December 26, 2024, 
following a brief hospital-
ization at the Massachusetts 
General Hospital.  

Helena was born in Chel-
sea on March 6,1961 to 
Maureen (Hearing) Bish-
op and Joseph Bishop. She 
grew up in Chelsea and 
Billerica and attended  Bil-
lerica schools.   She lived 
in Lowell for several years 
and again in Chelsea near 
the end of her life. 

Helena liked making arts 
and crafts, especially ce-
ramics; she loved her cats, 
especially Simba.  Above all 
Helena was the proudest of 
her daughter, Brittany, who 
was the light of her life.  

Helena is survived by her 
daughter, Brittany (Jordan) 
Pimental of LaCrosse, Flor-
ida; her mother, Maureen 
(Bishop) Halpin of Chelsea; 

sisters: Deborah (Wayne) 
Follansbee of Florida; 
Maureen Russo of Low-
ell; brother, John Bishop of 
Florida and several nieces 
and nephews.  She was pre-
deceased by her father, Jo-
seph Bishop and a brother, 
Rudy Ludemann. 

Final arrangements were 
made in Florida. In lieu of 
flowers, donations may be 
made in Helena’s mem-
ory to the Massachusetts 
Humane Society(www.
masshumane.org).

Roundup //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 6

Tips to celebrate Valentine’s Day with a loved one living with dementia
Valentine’s Day can pres-

ent unique challenges to 
relationships; loved ones 
living with dementia may 
not be able to express them-
selves or remember things 
as they did before the onset 
of the illness. To help care-
givers affected by dementia, 
the Alzheimer’s Foundation 
of America (AFA) is en-
couraging families to follow 
H.E.A.R.T.—five tips on 
how to celebrate Valentine’s 
Day with a loved one. 

Help your loved one 
reminisce: Reminiscence 
activities provide valuable 
cognitive stimulation for 
someone living with de-
mentia. Go through old 
photos together with your 
loved one and describe 
them—who the people are, 
where it was taken, what the 
occasion was, etc. Talking 
about moments you happily 

enjoyed together- whether 
it’s a vacation, celebration, 
or another occasion- is a 
great way to celebrate the 
love and special bond you 
share. Avoid asking the per-
son questions such as “do 
you remember this?”

Enjoy flowers together: 
The time-honored Valen-
tine’s Day gift of flowers 
can have therapeutic bene-
fits for someone living with 
dementia—the scent can be 
uplifting and can also stim-
ulate the brain. Purchase 
a bouquet of fresh flow-
ers (preferably ones which 
are non-toxic to humans or 
pets, such as roses, orchids, 
or sunflowers), set it on a ta-
ble, and enjoy the fragrance 
together.   

Adapt intimacy: Demen-
tia’s impact can make it dif-
ficult to do some things as 
you once did, but there are 

numerous ways to maintain, 
restore or create intimacy, 
love and connection.  Shar-
ing a meal, watching a fa-
miliar movie, enjoying fa-
vorite music, or just taking a 
walk together are all ways to 
help stay connected.   Non-
verbal cues, such as gentle 
touching, smiles, and eye 
contact, can also maintain 
or strengthen connections 
with someone who may no 
longer be able to verbalize 
their emotions as before. 

Reaffirm your feelings. 
Write a Valentine’s card 
and read it out loud to your 
loved one. Even if they can 
no longer grasp the full 
meaning, they might feel 
the sentiments you are ex-
pressing. The act of writing 
it and communicating your 
love can also raise your own 
spirits.

Talk in the person’s “love 

language”: People give or 
receive love through “love 
languages,” such as touch, 
words of affirmation, qual-
ity time, gifts, and acts of 
service. Know what types 
of gestures your loved one 
responds positively to and 
try to “speak to them” in 
that love language. Keep in 
mind that these may change 
over time as the demen-
tia-related illness progress-
es.

AFA’s Helpline, staffed 
entirely by licensed social 
workers who are specifical-
ly trained in dementia care, 
can provide additional in-
formation and support for 
families. The Helpline is 
available seven days a week 
by phone (866-232-8484), 
text message (646-586-
5283), and web chat (www.
alzfdn.org).

For 
Advertising

Rates, 
Please Call 

781-485-0588
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20 25Happy Valentine’s Day

Happy Valentine's Day 
♡ Ceclia Louise

Happy Valentine's Day Mommy, I love 
you, ♡ Julian

Happy Valentine's Day,  
♡ Elliana Rose

Happy Love Day Papa 
Love Mia & Maddie

Happy Valentine's Day,
Love Olivia & Elianna

Happy Valentines Day ♡
Love Lucy & Lily

Happy Valentine's Day Princess,  
Eldwin Alarcon & Jaleeyah Figueroa

WE LOVE YOU NANA and PAPA
♡ Jace Perkins & Miles Misci 

Happy Valentine's Day ♡ FigoHappy Valentine's Day 
Love Bella & Stellina

Happy Valentines Day Friends ♡ 
Love Jet

 ♥ Winona's First Valentine's Day ♥


